CITY OF FRISCO BID TABULATION
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BID NO.

11/03/08 2PM
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WATER, SEWER, METER PARTS-REBID

ACT PIPE AND SUPPLY
2011 CALIFORNIA CROSSING
DALLAS, TX 75220
MIKE BULLARD

FERGUSON WATERWORKS

10077 WEST UNIVERSITY

MCKINNEY, TX 75071

MATTHEW MONTGOMERY

MAINLINE SUPPLY
1519 STEVENS ST.
DALLAS, TX 75218
KENNETH RUBARTS

MUNICIPAL WATERWORKS SUPPLY
6959 STATE HWY. 276
ROYSE CITY, TX 75189

TIM BRATTON

PAGE 10F8 972-670-0023 972-434-2600 214-660-3662 972-636-2600
|
T % OFF %
Est % OFF % OFF
£ WFG UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | biscounT | EXTENDED
. Annual | BRAND [UNIT cosT| M€ | ExTENDED cosT BRAND cosr | Mreust | FET BRAND | oo | wrsuer | EXATY BRAND | NI | oiscounT ] EXTEND
Usage PRICE LIST PRICE
# |DESCRIPTION
4 NO BID WATEROUS | 1,235.00 4,940.00 NO BID 1,431.00 5,724.00
1 |3 FIRE HYDRANT
2|4 FIRE HYDRANT 6 NO BID WATEROUS | 4 28450 LS00 NOBID 1,575.00 9,450.00
3|5’ FIRE HYDRANT 10 NO BID WATEROUS | 1 34155 e NOBID 1,601.00 16.010.00
6" FIRE HYDRANT
4|EXTENSION -~ WATEROUS 10 NO BID WAIERES 182.55 A NOBID |ppy 209.37 2,093.70
&' FIRE HYDRANT
EXTENSION — AMERICAN 303.30 NO BID 351.80
5|DARLING 2 NO BID AFC 151.65 HRPI 175.90
6" FIRE HYDRANT
6|EXTENSION - MUELLER 10 NO BID MUELLER 214.00 2L NOBID |ipp) 246.60 2,466.00
&' FIRE HYDRANT
7|EXTENSION - M & H 5 NO BID HYDRANT REPAR |  212.00 o NOBID |rpy 214.74 1,073.70
72" FIRE HYDRANT
8|EXTENSION — WATEROUS 5 NO BID WATEROUS 214.00 AT NOBID |pp) 245.15 1.225.75
12" FIRE HYDRANT
EXTENSION — AMERICAN 930.00 NO BID 893.50
o|DARLING 5 NO BID AFC 186.00 HRPI 178.70
12" FIRE HYDRANT
10|EXTENSION — MUELLER 5 NO BID MEULLER 253.00 A3 NOBID |ipp) 291.48 1.457.40
12" FIRE HYDRANT
11|EXTENSION - M & H 5 NO BID HYDRANT REPAIR |  248.45 i NOBID |rpy 245.16 1,225.80
78" FIRE HYDRANT
12| EXTENSION — WATEROUS 5 NO BID WATEROUS 246.00 AR NOBID | ippy 280.95 1,404.75
18" FIRE HYDRANT
EXTENSION — AMERICAN 1,010.75 NO BID 1,154.25
13|DARLING 5 NO BID AFC 202.15 HRPI 230.85
18" FIRE HYDRANT
14| EXTENSION — MUELLER 5 NO BID MEULLER 289.00 i NOBID |ippy 326.42 1.632.10
18" FIRE HYDRANT
15|EXTENSION - M & H 5 NO BID HYDRANT REPAR | 28210 i NOBID |rpy 280.95 1,404.75
24" FIRE HYDRANT
16|EXTENSION — WATEROUS 5 NO BID WATEROUS 27255 A NOBID |ippy 316.74 1.583.70
24" FIRE HYDRANT
EXTENSION — AMERICAN 1,116.50 NO BID 1,297.40
17|DARLING 5 NO BID AFC 223.30 HRPI 259.48
24" FIRE HYDRANT
18|EXTENSION — MUELLER 5 NO BID MEULLER 327.00 LB NOBID | ippy 373.50 1.867.50
24" FIRE HYDRANT
19|EXTENSION - M & H 5 NO BID HYDRANT REPAIR | 306.40 DR NOBID |rpy 311.37 1,556.85
SAFETY REPAIR KIT-M&H
20|HYDRANT 5 NO BID HYDRANT REPAIR 92.10 AL NOBID  [iirpy 94.05 470.25
SAFETY REPAIR KIT-
21|MUELLER HYDRANT 5 NO BID MUELLER 93.45 A5 NOBID |rpy 119.38 596.90
SAFETY REPAIR KIT-
22| WATEROUS HYDRANT 20 NO BID WATEROUS 92.45 i NOBID  [iirpy 104.20 2,084.00
SAFETY REPAIR KIT —
23| AMERICAN DARLING 2 NO BID AFC 96.90 LB NOBID |rpy 105.64 211.28
MUELLER HYDRANT MAIN
24| VALVE GASKET 20 NO BID MUELLER 74.00 AL NOBID  [iirpy 56.54 113080




WATEROUS HYDRANT
25|MAIN VALVE GASKET 20 NO BID WATEROUS 29.50 S NOBID  |yrpi 56.54 1.130.80
M&H HYDRANT MAIN
26|VALVE GASKET 20 NO BID HYDRANT REPAIR 42.95 CERHE NOBID [iirei 51.80 1,036.00
AMERICAN DARLING MAIN
27|VALVE GASKET 2 NO BID AFC 60.00 U NOBID  |yrpi 58.74 117.48
28[18"24” CI VALVE BOX 20 NO BID STAR/SIGMA 38.00 760.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 4092 818.40
29]247-36" CI VALVE BOX 20 NO BID STAR/SIGMA 50.00 1,000.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 55.70 1,114.00
30]48"59" CI VALVE BOX 20 NO BID STAR/SIGMA 92.50 1,850.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 96.59 1,931.80
14™-CI VALVE BOX
31|EXTENSION 20 NO BID STARISIGMA 23.65 473.00 NOBID |sicma 25.57 51140
32[2"-CI VALVE BOX EXT 15 NO BID STARISIGMA 30.55 458.25 NOBID _|SIGMA 32.96 494.40
33[2" VALVE BOX RISER 30 NO BID STARISIGMA 11.50 345.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 11.37 341.10
344" VALVE BOX RISER 30 NO BID STARISIGMA 19.30 579.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 18.20 546.00
356" VALVE BOX RISER 30 NO BID STARISIGMA 22.10 663.00 NOBID _|SIGMA 21.60 648.00
2 1/2 "WATEROUS HOSE
36|NOZZLE 30 NO BID WATEROUS 62.50 S NOBID  |empire 92.00 2,760.00
4"WATEROUS STEAMER
37|NOzZLE 15 NO BID WATEROUS 162.00 2,430.00 NOBID  lempire 252.00 3,780.00
2 1/2" MUELLER HOSE
38|NOZZLE 15 NO BID MUELLER 34.50 S NOBID  |empire 58.50 87750
4 MUELLER STEAMER
39|NOZZLE 10 NO BID MUELLER 112.00 1,120.00 NOBID  lempire 160.00 1,600.00
40[2 1/2" M&H HOSE NOZZLE 30 NO BID ME&H 67.50 2,025.00 NOBID _|EMPIRE 97.40 2,922.00
41|4" M&H STEAMER NOZZLE 15 NO BID M&H 160.00 IS NOBID  |evpire 22950 3,44250
WATEROUS 5-1/4 BRONZE
42|VALVE SEAT 20 NO BID WATEROUS 202.50 4,050.00 NOBID  lempire 293.00 5,860.00
MUELLER 5-1/4 BRONZE
43|VALVE SEAT 10 NO BID MEULLER 134.00 i NOBID  |evpire 193.00 1,930.00
2 IP GATE VALVE (SQ.
44|NUT) 6|MeH 180.00 1,080.00|AFC 175.00 1,050.00 NOBID  lempire 185.00 1,110.00
45[6" MJ GATE VALVE 12| ven 375.00 4,500.00[AFC 369.75 4,437.00 NOBID _|EMPIRE 383.00 4,596.00
466" MJ X FL GATE VALVE 1|meH 375.00 375.00|AFC 372.80 372.80 NOBID _|EMPIRE 383.00 383.00
47[8"MJ GATE VALVE 6|meH 600.00 3,600.00]AFC 590.30 3,541.80 NOBID _|EMPIRE 609.00 3,654.00
28[12" MJ GATE VALVE 2|MeH 1,185.00 2,370.00]AFC 1,167.15 2,334.30 NOBID _|EMPIRE 1,199.00 2,398.00
WATER VALVE AND
HYDRANT EXTENDED PRICE
SUBTOTAL= $11,925.00 $86,282.25 NO BID $102,368.56
WATER
MAINTENANCE
GROUP
2x3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
49|SADDLE 10|FoRD 12.09 120.90|CAMBRIDGE 13.60 136.00|FORD 12.25 122.50|FORD 11.75 117.50
2X1 BRONZE TAPPING
50| SADDLE 6]FOrRD 12.09 72.54| CAMBRIDGE 13.60 81.60|FORD 12.25 73.50|FORD 11.69 70.14
4X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
51|SADDLE 1|ForD 53.57 53.57| CAMBRIDGE 58.33 58.33| FORD 54.20 54.20|FORD 51.90 51.90
4X1 BRONZE TAPPING
52|SADDLE 1|ForD 53.57 53.57| CAMBRIDGE 58.33 58.33|FORD 54.20 54.20| FORD 51.90 51.90
4X2 BRONZE TAPPING
53| SADDLE 1|ForD 68.00 68.00| CAMBRIDGE 71.05 71.05|FORD 68.90 68.90|FORD 65.90 65.90
6X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
54|SADDLE 12|ForD 63.09 757.08| CAMBRIDGE 67.09 805.08|FORD 63.90 766.80|FORD 61.15 733.80
6X1 BRONZE TAPPING
55| SADDLE 12|FORD 63.09 757.08]| CAMBRIDGE 67.09 805.08|FORD 63.90 766.80 | FORD 61.15 733.80)
6X1-1/2 BRONZE TAPPING
56|SADDLE 12|ForD 7214 865.68| CAMBRIDGE 77.45 929.40|FORD 73.00 876.00|FORD 69.90 838.80
6X2 BRONZE TAPPING
57|SADDLE 12|FORD 79.26 951.12| CAMBRIDGE 85.65 1,027.80|FORD 80.30 963.60 |FORD 76.84 922.08
8X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
58| SADDLE 24|ForD 78.08 1,873.92| CAMBRIDGE 81.55 1,957.20|FORD 79.10 1,898.40|FORD 75.70 1,816.80




8X1 BRONZE TAPPING
59[SADDLE 24|FORD 78.08 1,873.92|CAMBRIDGE 81.55 1,957.20|FORD 79.10 1,898.40|FORD 75.70 1,816.80
8X1-1/2 BRONZE TAPPING
60|SADDLE 24|FORD 82.22 1,973.28| CAMBRIDGE 85.85 2,060.40|FORD 83.30 1,999.20|FORD 79.70 1,912.80]
8X2 BRONZE TAPPING
61[SADDLE 24|FORD 89.49 2,147.76|CAMBRIDGE 94.16 2,259.84|FORD 90.60 2,174.40|FORD 86.75 2,082.00
12X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
62|SADDLE 24|FORD 113.21 2,717.04]CAMBRIDGE 119.35 2,864.40|FORD 114.70 2,752.80|FORD 109.75 2,634.00
12X1 BRONZE TAPPING
63|SADDLE 24|FORD 113.21 2,717.04|]CAMBRIDGE 119.35 2,864.40|FORD 114.70 2,752.80|FORD 109.75 2,634.00
12X1-1/2 BRONZE TAPPING
64|SADDLE 24|FORD 127.71 3,065.04| CAMBRIDGE 134.12 3,218.88|FORD 129.40 3,105.60|FORD 123.00 2,952.00
12X2 BRONZE TAPPING
65|SADDLE 24|FORD 130.00 3,120.00|CAMBRIDGE 136.00 3,264.00|FORD 131.70 3,160.80|FORD 126.00 3,024.00
16"X3/4" DOUBLE STRAP
66|BRASS TAPPING SADDLE 12|FORD 277.25 3,327.00|ROMAC 181.50 2,178.00|FORD 280.90 3,370.80|FORD 268.77 3,225.24
16"X1" DOUBLE STRAP
67|BRASS TAPPING SADDLE 12|FORD 277.25 3,327.00|JROMAC 181.50 2,178.00|FORD 280.90 3,370.80|FORD 268.77 3,225.24
16"X1 1/2" DOUBLE STRAP
68|BRASS TAPPING SADDLE 12|FORD 294.19 3,530.28| ROMAC 196.75 2,361.00]FORD 298.00 3,576.00|FORD 285.15 3,421.80
16"X2" DOUBLE STRAP
69|BRASS TAPPING SADDLE 12|FORD 325.09 3,901.08|ROMAC 197.75 2,373.00]FORD 329.40 3,952.80| FORD 315.15 3,781.80
70|ALL FITTINGS HAVE MINIMUM WORKING P.S.I. 250
7116” MJ 90 2|STAR 43.35 86.70|TYLER/SIG/STAR 47.10 94.20|TYLER 46.95 93.90|TYLER/SIG 46.46 92.92
726" MJ 45 2|STAR 37.63 75.26|TYLER/SIG/STAR 40.90 81.80|TYLER 40.75 81.50|TYLER/SIG 40.00 80.00
73|6” MJ 22-1/2 2|STAR 38.84 77.68|TYLER/SIG/STAR 42.18 84.36|TYLER 42.00 84.00|TYLER/SIG 41.62 83.24
7416" MJ 11-1/4 2|STAR 37.03 74.06|TYLER/SIG/STAR 40.22 80.44|TYLER 40.10 80.20|TYLER/SIG 39.68 79.36
75|6X24 ANCHOR COUPLING 10|STAR 104.94 1,049.40|TYLER/SIG/STAR 103.33 1,033.30|TYLER 103.00 1,030.00|TYLER/SIG 101.94 1,019.40
76|ANCHOR 90 10|STAR 90.32 903.20|TYLER/SIG/STAR 91.56 915.60|TYLER 91.30 913.00|TYLER/SIG 90.35 903.50
778" MJ90 2|STAR 67.44 134.88|TYLER/SIG/STAR 73.25 146.50|TYLER 73.00 146.00|TYLER/SIG 72.25 144.50
78|8" MJ45 2|STAR 58.41 116.82|TYLER/SIG/STAR 63.45 126.90|TYLER 63.25 126.50|TYLER/SIG 62.55 125.10
79|8"MJ 22-1/2 2|STAR 59.01 118.02|TYLER/SIG/STAR 64.10 128.20|TYLER 63.90 127.80|TYLER/SIG 63.23 126.46
80(8" MJ 11-1/4 2|STAR 56.60 113.20|TYLER/SIG/STAR 61.48 122.96|TYLER 61.30 122.60|TYLER/SIG 60.65 121.30
81[12" MJ 90 2|STAR 135.78 271.56|TYLER/SIG/STAR 148.00 296.00|TYLER 147.00 294.00|TYLER/SIG 145.50 291.00
82[12" MJ 45 2|STAR 109.89 219.78|TYLER/SIG/STAR 119.40 238.80|TYLER 119.00 238.00|TYLER/SIG 117.75 235.50
83[6” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 48|STAR 11.14 534.72|TYLER/SIG/STAR 14.78 709.44|TYLER 12.05 578.40|TYLER/SIG 11.94 573.12
84(8” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 48|STAR 13.55 650.40| TYLER/SIG/STAR 17.95 861.60|TYLER 14.65 703.20|TYLER/SIG 14.52 696.96
85[12" GLAND PACK & BOLTS 48|STAR 19.12 917.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 25.45 1,221.60|TYLER 20.90 1,003.20|TYLER/SIG 20.95 1,005.60
86[16” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 18|STAR 43.81 788.58| TYLER/SIG/STAR 47.45 854.10|TYLER 47.40 853.20|TYLER/SIG 46.95 845.10
87[18” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 18|STAR 79.33 1,427.94|TYLER/SIG/STAR 85.95 1,547.10|TYLER 85.90 1,546.20|TYLER/SIG 85.00 1,530.00
88[20” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 12|STAR 84.15 1,009.80|TYLER/SIG/STAR 91.15 1,093.80|TYLER 91.10 1,093.20|TYLER/SIG 90.15 1,081.80
89[24” GLAND PACK & BOLTS 12|STAR 92.13 1,105.56| TYLER/SIG/STAR 99.78 1,197.36|TYLER 99.70 1,196.40|TYLER/SIG 98.70 1,184.40
90(6” MEGA LUB & BOLTS 48|STAR 34.00 1,632.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 31.50 1,512.00|SIGMA 27.60 1,324.80|EBBA 37.55 1,802.40
91(8” MEGA LUB & BOLTS 48|STAR 45.00 2,160.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 42.70 2,049.60|SIGMA 38.50 1,848.00|EBBA 50.86 2,441.28
92[12" MEGA LUG & BOLTS 24|STAR 82.00 1,968.00| TYLER/SIG/STAR 78.00 1,872.00|SIGMA 75.10 1,802.40|EBBA 92.96 2,231.04
93[16” MEGA LUB & BOLTS 12|STAR 176.00 2,112.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 166.45 1,997.40|SIGMA 134.40 1,612.80|EBBA 189.78 2,277.36
94[18” MEGA LUG & BOLTS 8|STAR 209.00 1,672.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 201.00 1,608.00|SIGMA 183.60 1,468.80|EBBA 229.38 1,835.04
95[20”" MEGA LUB & BOLTS 8|STAR 254.00 2,032.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 244.80 1,958.40|SIGMA 264.00 2,112.00|EBBA 280.89 2,247.12
96(24" DI RETAINER GLAND 8|STAR 153.00 1,224.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 270.83 2,166.64|SIGMA 156.40 1,251.20|EBBA 290.15 2,321.20
97(30” DI RETAINER GLAND 8|STAR 456.00 3,648.00| TYLER/SIG/STAR 700.85 5,606.80|SIGMA 466.20 3,729.60|EBBA 716.75 5,734.00
98(36” DI RETAINER GLAND 8|STAR 605.00 4,840.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 912.00 7,296.00|SIGMA 619.00 4,952.00(EBBA 954.95 7,639.60
99(42" DI RETAINER GLAND 8|STAR 819.00 6,552.00| TYLER/SIG/STAR 1,230.00 9,840.00|SIGMA 838.00 6,704.00|EBBA 1,282.66 10,261.28
100|6” MJ PLUG 4|STAR 17.76 71.04|TYLER/SIG/STAR 19.29 77.16|TYLER 19.20 76.80|TYLER/SIG 18.85 75.40
101|6” MJ CAP 4|STAR 16.56 66.24| TYLER/SIG/STAR 17.93 71.72|TYLER 17.90 71.60|TYLER/SIG 17.55 70.20
102|8” MJ PLUG 4|STAR 26.19 104.76| TYLER/SIG/ISTAR 28.36 113.44|TYLER 28.35 113.40|TYLER/SIG 27.77 111.08
103|8” MJ CAP 4|STAR 26.19 104.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 28.36 113.44|TYLER 28.35 113.40|TYLER/SIG 27.77 111.08
104]12" MJ PLUG 2|STAR 49.38 98.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 53.46 106.92|TYLER 53.40 106.80|TYLER/SIG 52.35 104.70
105|12" MJ CAP 2|STAR 49.38 98.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 54.10 108.20|TYLER 54.10 108.20|TYLER/SIG 52.95 105.90
10616” MJ TEE 2|STAR 59.91 119.82|TYLER/SIG/STAR 65.10 130.20|TYLER 64.90 129.80|TYLER/SIG 63.50 127.00
10718" MJ TEE 2|STAR 90.02 180.04|TYLER/SIG/STAR 98.67 197.34|TYLER 97.50 195.00|TYLER/SIG 95.45 190.90




108[12" MJ TEE 2|STAR 186.37 372. 74| TYLER/SIG/STAR 204.27 408.54|TYLER 201.80 403.60| TYLER/SIG 197.55 395.10
6”2 BOLT HY MAX
109|DRESSER COUPLING 24|HYMAX 153.00 3,672.00|HYMEX 170.46 4,091.04|HYMAX 160.00 3,840.00|TPS 158.84 3,812.16
8”2 BOLT HY MAX
110|DRESSING COUPLING 24|HYMAX 174.00 4,176.00|HYMEX 193.00 4,632.00|HYMAX 180.00 4,320.00|TPS 179.88 4,317.12
111|6X12 SLEEVE 24|STAR 40.95 982.80| TYLER/SIG/STAR 44.80 1,075.20|TYLER 44.30 1,063.20| TYLER/SIG 43.45 1,042.80]
112|8X12 SLEEVE 24|STAR 53.59 1,286.16| TYLER/SIG/STAR 58.74 1,409.76]TYLER 58.00 1,392.00|TYLER/SIG 56.81 1,363.44
113]12X12 SLEEVE 24|STAR 87.01 2,088.24| TYLER/SIG/STAR 95.37 2,288.88|TYLER 94.20 2,260.80|TYLER/SIG 93.23 2,237.52
114[16” SLEEVE 4|STAR 222.19 888.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 243.54 974.16|TYLER 240.60 962.40|TYLER/SIG 238.07 952.28
115/18" SLEEVE 4|STAR 440.77 1,763.08| TYLER/SIG/STAR 483.12 1,932.48|TYLER 477.40 1,909.60|TYLER/SIG 472.26 1,889.04/
116|20" SLEEVE 4|STAR 446.19 1,784.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 489.06 1,956.24|TYLER 483.20 1,932.80|TYLER/SIG 478.07 1,912.28
117|24” SLEEVE 4|STAR 649.72 2,598.88| TYLER/SIG/STAR 712.14 2,848.56| TYLER 703.70 2,814.80|TYLER/SIG 696.13 2,784.52
118|30" SLEEVE 4|STAR 1,549.94 6,199.76| TYLER/SIG/STAR 1,698.84 6,795.36| TYLER 1,678.00 6,712.00|TYLER/SIG 660.65 2,642.60
119|36” SLEEVE 4|STAR 2,480.56 9,922.24|TYLER/SIG/STAR 2,718.87 10,875.48|TYLER 2,680.00 10,720.00|TYLER/SIG 657.95 2,631.80
120(42" SLEEVE 4|STAR 3,402.75 13,611.00|TYLER/SIG/STAR 3,684.00 14,736.00|TYLER 3,680.00 14,720.00|TYLER/SIG 645.81 2,583.24
121|%" BRASS TEE 8|MERIT 3.64 29.12|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 4.31 34.48]|MATCO 3.30 26.40|ANDERSON 4.16 33.28
122|1"BRASS TEE 8|MERIT 6.46 51.68| FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 7.66 61.28]MATCO 5.90 47.20| ANDERSON 7.36 58.88
123|1-1/2" BRASS TEE 8|MERIT 12.48 99.84|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 14.80 118.40|MATCO 11.30 90.40|ANDERSON 14.25 114.00
124[2" BRASS TEE 8|MERIT 16.36 130.88|FWY/TRENTON/ROFE| 24.25 194.00|MATCO 18.60 148.80| ANDERSON 23.34 186.72
125[2" X ALL BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 6.78 135.60)FWY/TRENTON/ROF] 8.14 162.80JMATCO 6.50 130.00|ANDERSON 7.70 154.00
126)|1X4 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 4.90 98.00|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 5.79 115.80JMATCO 4.70 94.00|ANDERSON 5.59 111.80
127]1X6 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 7.21 144.20)FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 8.66 173.20|MATCO 6.90 138.00|ANDERSON 8.18 163.60
128)|2X4 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 11.05 221.00)FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 13.27 265.40|MATCO 10.60 212.00|ANDERSON 12.45 249.00
129)2X6 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 16.33 326.60|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 19.58 391.60JMATCO 15.70 314.00|ANDERSON 18.32 366.40
130|% ALL BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 1.54 30.80|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 1.85 37.00JMATCO 1.50 30.00|ANDERSON 179 35.80
131]%.X4 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 3.39 67.80| FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 4.05 81.00|MATCO 3.20 64.00|ANDERSON 3.94 78.80
132|%.X6 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 4.94 98.80| FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 5.92 118.40|MATCO 4.70 94.00|ANDERSON 5.75 115.00
133]|1 X ALL BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 2.28 45.60|FWY/TRENTON/ROF¥ 272 54.40|MATCO 2.20 44.00|ANDERSON 2.64 52.80
134[1-1/2 ALL BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 4.45 89.00|FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 5.34 106.80JMATCO 4.20 84.00|ANDERSON 5.03 100.60
135[1-1/2X4 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 8.60 172.00JFWY/TRENTON/ROF| 10.31 206.20|MATCO 8.20 164.00|ANDERSON 9.66 193.20
1361-1/2X6 BRASS NIPPLE 20|MERIT 12.70 254.00)FWY/TRENTON/ROF| 15.24 304.80JMATCO 12.20 244.00|ANDERSON 14.30 286.00
137[1” COMP X MIP ADAPTER 20|FORD 8.45 169.00)CAMBRIDGE 8.95 179.00JFORD 8.60 172.00|FORD 8.20 164.00
138[1" COMP X FIP ADAPTER 50|FORD 10.19 509.50]CAMBRIDGE 10.95 547.50]FORD 10.40 520.00|FORD 9.88 494.00
139[1” COMP X COMP 90 4|FORD 14.43 57.72|CAMBRIDGE 17.91 71.64]FORD 14.80 59.20|FORD 13.99 55.96
140(2" COMP X MIP ADAPTER 20|FORD 30.85 617.00) CAMBRIDGE 32.65 653.00FORD 31.60 632.00|FORD 29.91 598.20
141[2" COMP X FIP ADAPTER 50|FORD 32.25 1,612.50]CAMBRIDGE 34.30 1,715.00]FORD 33.00 1,650.00|FORD 31.27 1,563.50
%" COMP X COMP
142|COUPLING 50|FORD 8.69 434.50|CAMBRIDGE 9.43 471.50|FORD 8.90 445.00|FORD 8.43 421.50
143[%” COMP X MIP ADAPTER 25|FORD 7.14 178.50| CAMBRIDGE 7.74 193.50)FORD 7.30 182.50|FORD 6.92 173.00
144|COMP X FIP ADAPTER 50|FORD 7.51 375.50| CAMBRIDGE 8.13 406.50|FORD 7.70 385.00|FORD 7.28 364.00
1" COMP X COMP
145|COUPLING 50|FORD 9.95 497.50|CAMBRIDGE 10.78 539.00JFORD 10.20 510.00|FORD 9.65 482.50
1-1/2" COMP X COMP
146|COUPLING 50|FORD 30.42 1,521.00|]CAMBRIDGE 31.81 1,590.50|FORD 31.20 1,560.00|FORD 29.49 1,474.50
1-1/2" COMP X MIP
147|ADAPTER 50|FORD 21.17 1,058.50|]CAMBRIDGE 22.60 1,130.00|FORD 21.70 1,085.00|FORD 20.52 1,026.00
1-1/2" COMP X FIP
148|ADAPTER 50|FORD 27.08 1,354.00|CAMBRIDGE 28.90 1,445.00|FORD 27.70 1,385.00|FORD 26.25 1,312.50
2" COMP X COMP
149|COUPLING 50|FORD 41.07 2,053.50|]CAMBRIDGE 43.83 2,191.50|FORD 42.10 2,105.00|FORD 39.85 1,992.50
150(%" BRASS COUPLING 4|MERIT 2.40 9.60|TRENTON 2.85 11.40|MATCO 2.30 9.20|FORD 2.74 10.96
151[1" BRASS COUPLING 4|MERIT 3.64 14 56| TRENTON 4.32 17.28]|MATCO 3.50 14.00|ANDERSON 4.16 16.64
1521-1/2" BRASS COUPLING 4|MERIT 7.74 30.96] TRENTON 9.16 36.64]MATCO 7.40 29.60|{ANDERSON 8.80 35.20




153|2" BRASS COUPLING 20|MERIT 12.73 254.60) TRENTON 15.09 301.80|MATCO 12.20 244.00| ANDERSON 14.50 290.00
154|% X % BRASS BUSHING 2|MERIT 1.59 3.18|TRENTON 1.88 3.76]MATCO 1.60 3.20|ANDERSON 1.76 3.52
155|1 X %> BRASS BUSHING 2|MERIT 2.40 4.80| TRENTON 2.84 5.68|MATCO 2.40 4.80|ANDERSON 2.74 5.48
1561 X % BRASS BUSHING 8|MERIT 2.40 19.20|TRENTON 2.84 22.72|MATCO 2.40 19.20|ANDERSON 2.74 21.92
157|1-1/2 X % BRASS BUSHING 8|MERIT 6.38 51.04| TRENTON 7.57 60.56|MATCO 6.15 49.20| ANDERSON 7.27 58.16
1581-1/2 X 1 BRASS BUSHING 12|MERIT 521 62.52)] TRENTON 6.18 74.16|MATCO 5.00 60.00| ANDERSON 5.98 71.76
1-1/2 X 1-1/4 BRASS
159|BUSHING 8|MERIT 5.21 41.68| TRENTON 6.18 49.44|MATCO 5.00 40.00|ANDERSON 5.98 47.84
160|2 X % BRASS BUSHING 8|MERIT 9.31 74.48| TRENTON 11.04 88.32|MATCO 8.90 71.20|ANDERSON 10.63 85.04
161)|2 X % BRASS BUSHING 8|MERIT 9.31 74.48| TRENTON 11.04 88.32|MATCO 8.90 71.20|ANDERSON 10.63 85.04
162)|2 X 1 BRASS BUSHING 12|MERIT 9.31 111.72|TRENTON 11.04 132.48]|MATCO 8.90 106.80| ANDERSON 10.63 127.56
1632 X 1-1/2 BRASS BUSHING 12|MERIT 7.74 92.88| TRENTON 9.16 109.92|MATCO 7.40 88.80| ANDERSON 8.80 105.60
1643/4" CC BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT 4.00 96.00) TRENTON 7.75 186.00)FORD 4.10 98.40| ANDERSON 5.68 136.32
165(3/4" IP BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT 1.74 41.76]TRENTON 2.05 49.20|MATCO 1.60 38.40| ANDERSON 1.99 47.76
166|1" CC BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT 6.00 144.00) TRENTON 8.10 194.40]FORD 6.00 144.00|ANDERSON 7.00 168.00
167|1" IP BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT 2.29 54.96| TRENTON 271 65.04]MATCO 2.05 49.20| ANDERSON 2.64 63.36
1681 1/2" CC BRASS PLUG 10|MERIT NO BID NO BID TRENTON 13.05 130.50JFORD 12.50 125.00|ANDERSON 24.50 245.00
169(1 1/2" IP BRASS PLUG 10|MERIT 4.34 43.40|TRENTON 5.14 51.40|MATCO 3.90 39.00|ANDERSON 4.94 49.40
170|2" CC BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT NO BID NO BID TRENTON 16.90 405.60|FORD 16.20 388.80| ANDERSON 28.50 684.00
171|2" IP BRASS PLUG 24|MERIT 6.84 164.16)] TRENTON 8.10 194.40|MATCO 6.20 148.80| ANDERSON 7.82 187.68
2" COMP X IP CURB STOP
172|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 6]FORD 118.73 712.38| CAMBRIDGE 120.43 722.58|FORD 120.60 723.60|FORD 115.10 690.60
% “ COMP CORP BALL
173|TYPE 120|FORD 23.03 2,763.60|] CAMBRIDGE 16.95 2,034.00|FORD 23.40 2,808.00|FORD 22.35 2,682.00
% “ CORP IP X COMP BALL
174|TYPE 40]FORD 23.03 921.20JCAMBRIDGE 17.29 691.60]FORD 23.40 936.00|FORD 22.35 894.00
175[1" COMP CORP BALL TYPE 250|FORD 30.29 7,672.50|CAMBRIDGE 25.65 6,412.50|FORD 30.70 7,675.00|FORD 29.37 7,342.50
1-1/2” COMP CORP BALL
176|TYPE 20|FORD 62.07 1,241.40|]CAMBRIDGE 67.32 1,346.40|FORD 63.00 1,260.00|FORD 60.18 1,203.60
177[2" COMP CORP BALL TYPE 50|FORD 102.66 5,133.00|CAMBRIDGE 109.21 5,460.50|FORD 104.30 5,215.00|FORD 99.50 4,975.00
% “ COMP ANGLE STOP
178|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 120|FORD 38.11 4,573.20| CAMBRIDGE 25.25 3,030.00|FORD 36.70 4,404.00[FORD 35.00 4,200.00
1" COMP ANGLE STOP
179|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 300|FORD 54.22 16,266.00|CAMBRIDGE 55.35 16,605.00|FORD 55.00 16,500.00|FORD 52.57 15,771.00
1-1/2” COMP ANGLE STOP
180|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 20|FORD 114.37 2,287.40| CAMBRIDGE 123.55 2,471.00|FORD 116.20 2,324.00|FORD 110.87 2,217.40
2" COMP ANGLE STOP
181|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 50|FORD 145.18 7,259.00|CAMBRIDGE 156.00 7,800.00|FORD 147.50 7,375.00|FORD 140.75 7,037.50
% “ COMP X 1P CURB STOP
182|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 20|FORD 28.68 573.60| CAMBRIDGE 28.41 568.20)FORD 29.10 582.00|FORD 27.81 556.20
1" COMP X IP CURB STOP
183|FULL PORT BALL TYPE 20|FORD 43.52 870.40|CAMBRIDGE 46.12 922.40)FORD 44.20 884.00|FORD 42.20 844.00
8 X 15 AC FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN BOLTS &
184|LUGS 25|FORD 90.57 2,264.25|ROMAC 131.46 3,286.50|FORD 83.90 2,097.50|FORD 86.41 2,160.25
12 X 15 CI FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN BOLTS &
185|LUGS 25|FORD 124.37 3,109.25|ROMAC 194.07 4,851.75|FORD 113.40 2,835.00|FORD 120.00 3,000.00
16 X 24 CI FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN BOLTS &
186|LUGS 10|FORD 371.84 3,718.40|ROMAC 684.25 6,842.50|FORD 281.00 2,810.00|FORD 357.11 3,571.10
6 X 15 Cl FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN B OLTS &
187|LUGS 25|FORD 82.80 2,070.00|ROMAC 107.74 2,693.50|FORD 80.70 2,017.50|FORD 79.64 1,991.00]
6 X 15 AC FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN BOLTS &
188|LUGS 25|FORD 89.01 2,225.25|ROMAC 107.74 2,693.50|FORD 80.70 2,017.50|FORD 85.56 2,139.00




8 X 15 CI FULL CIRCLE
CLAMP W/STAIN BOLTS &

189[LUGS 25|FORD 93.08 2,327.00JROMAC 131.46 3,286.50|FORD 84.20 2,105.00|FORD 88.72 2,218.00
WATER
PIPE/TUBING/PLASTIC

190[WRAP & TAPE
6” CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK

191|BLUE 240 4.96 1,190.40| DIAMOND/NAPCO 4.32 1,036.80| DIAMOND/J-M 5.30 1,272.00 [ DIAMOND/NA 7.00 1,680.00!
8" CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK

192|BLUE 240 8.53 2,047.20| DIAMOND/NAPCO 7.42 1,780.80| DIAMOND/J-M 9.15 2,196.00 [ DIAMOND/NA 12.00 2,880.00|
12" CL150 PVC DR 18-GSK

193|BLUE 240 14.51 3,482.40| DIAMOND/NAPCO 15.20 3,648.00| DIAMOND/J-M 15.60 3,744.00 [ DIAMOND/NA 25.91 6,218.40
16” CL150 PVC DR 18 -GSK

194|BLUE 120 24.43 2,931.60| DIAMOND/NAPCO 20.69 2,482.80| DIAMOND/J-M 25.30 3,036.00 [ DIAMOND/NA 32.56 3,907.20|
18" CL150 PVC DR18-GSK

195(BLUE 80 33.44 2,675.20| DIAMOND/NAPCO 26.93 2,154.40| DIAMOND/J-M 31.90 2,552.00 [ DIAMOND/NA 42.15 3,372.00
20" CL150 PVC DR18-GSK

196 |BLUE 80 41.68 3,334.40| DIAMOND/NAPCO 32.95 2,636.00| DIAMOND/J-M 39.30 3,144.00 [DIAMOND/NA 52.52 4,201.60|

197|30” DUCTILE IRON PIPE 40 114.00 4,560.00|ACIPCO 122.00 4,880.00|[ MCWANE 110.00 4,400.00|MCWANE 115.99 4,639.60|

198|36” DUCTILE IRON PIPE 40 169.00 6,760.00JACIPCO 165.00 6,600.00| MCWANE 148.00 5,920.00[ MCWANE 156.15 6,246.00|

199|% COPPER TUBING “K” 1500 4.79 7,185.00|MUELLER 4.25 6,375.00|MUELLER 4.00 6,000.00[HOWELL 4.61 6,915.00|

200|1” COPPER TUBING ‘K" 2000 5.50 11,000.00|MUELLER 5.45 10,900.00|MUELLER 5.30 10,600.00 [HOWELL 5.71 11,420.00

201|1-1/2 COPPER TUBING “K" 300! 10.73 3,219.00|MUELLER 8.95 2,685.00|MUELLER 8.60 2,580.00[HOWELL 15.95 4,785.00]

202|2" COPPER TUBING ‘K" 400! 14.00 5,600.00|MUELLER 10.95 4,380.00|MUELLER 10.00 4,000.00|HOWELL 15.95 6,380.00|
3/4” Poly Pipe 200 PSI

203|Rating 1000 0.29 290.00|POLY 0.23 230.00|ENDOT 0.25 250.00|SILVERLINE 0.24 240.00

204[1” Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating 1500 0.60 900.00|POLY 0.38 570.00|ENDOT 0.35 525.00|SILVERLINE 0.39 585.00
1 %" Poly Pipe 200 PSI

205|Rating 200 1.24 248.00|POLY 0.72 144.00|ENDOT 0.80 160.00|SILVERLINE 1.10 220.00

206|2” Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating 400! 2.16 864.00|POLY 1.11 444.00|ENDOT 1.20 480.00SILVERLINE 1.25 500.00

207|%" SS INS stiffner CTS 200 1.00 200.00| CAMBRIDGE 1.13 226.00|FORD 0.92 184.00|FORD 1.00 200.00,

208[1” SS INS Stiffner CTS 250 1.00 250.00| CAMBRIDGE 1.25 312.50|FORD 0.97 242.50|FORD 1.00 250.00

209(1 %" SS INS Stiffner CTS 50 2.00 100.00| CAMBRIDGE 2.46 123.00|FORD 1.35 67.50| FORD 1.32 66.00

210[2" SS INS Stiffner CTS 100 2.00 200.00| CAMBRIDGE 4.13 413.00|FORD 1.35 135.00|FORD 1.32 132.00!

211|PLASTIC PIPE WRAP 120 85.00 10,200.00| CAMBRIDGE 75.50 9,060.00 57.00 6,840.00| FORD 61.00 7,320.00

212|BLACK PLASTIC TAPE 10 108.00 1,080.00|] CAMBRIDGE 4.50 45.00 91.20 912.00|FORD 61.00 610.00,

213[1-1/4" 2 BOLT DRESSER 6. 30.00 180.00|ROMAC 12.95 77.70|FORD 23.20 139.20|SB 23.43 140.58|

214[1-1/2" 2 BOLT DRESSER 20 30.00 600.00|ROMAC 15.48 309.60|FORD 26.90 538.00|SB 27.98 559.60

215[2" 2 BOLT DRESSER 20 40.00 800.00|ROMAC 18.90 378.00|FORD 33.90 678.00|SB 31.71 634.20

WATER MAINTENANCE

GROUP EXTENDED PRICE

SUBTOTAL= $274,587.47 $284,640.26 $268,465.00 $267,145.65
SEWER MAINTENANCE
24X2 MANHOLE RISER

216|CAST IRON 40| SIGMA 78.00 3,120.00|SIGMA 72.50 2,900.00|SIGMA 67.00|n/c 2,680.00|SIGMA 75.30 3,012.00]
24X2 MANHOLE RISER

217[CONCRETE 40 17.00 680.00SIGMA 17.50 700.00|CHOICE 18.00 21.00 720.00|AMER. MATC| 13.60 544.00
24X4 MANHOLE RISER

218|CAST IRON 15|SIGMA 104.00 1,560.00| SIGMA 96.50 1,447.50|SIGMA 89.00|n/c 1,335.00|SIGMA 100.00 1,500.00
24X6 MANHOLE RISER

219|CAST IRON 15|SIGMA 158.00 2,370.00|SIGMA 153.00 2,295.00|SIGMA 135.00(n/c 2,025.00|SIGMA 151.75 2,276.25]
4" SDR 35 PVC PIPE

220|(GREEN) 400|SIGMA 0.83 332.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 0.72 288.00| DIAMOND/JM 0.85|n/c 340.00| DIAMOND/NA| 113 452.00
6" SDR 35 PVC PIPE

221|(GREEN) 200|SIGMA 1.77 354.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 1.54 308.00| DIAMOND/JM 1.80|n/c 360.00| DIAMOND/NA| 2.51 502.00




8" SDR 35 PVC PIPE

222|(GREEN) 100|SIGMA 3.18 318.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 2.76 276.00| DIAMOND/IM 3.25|n/c 325.00| DIAMOND/NA| 4.54 454.00
10" SDR 35 PVC PIPE
223|(GREEN) 100|SIGMA 4.98 498.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 4.32 432.00|DIAMOND/AIM 5.10|n/c 510.00| DIAMOND/NA| 7.10 710.00
12" SDR 35 PVC PIPE
224|(GREEN) 100|SIGMA 7.16 716.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 6.21 621.00| DIAMOND/IM 7.30|n/c 730.00| DIAMOND/NA| 10.20 1,020.00
15" SDR 35 PVC PIPE
225|(GREEN) 100|SIGMA 10.63 1,063.00|NAPCO/DIAMOND 9.24 924.00|DIAMOND/IM 10.90|n/c 1,090.00| DIAMOND/NA| 1512 1,5612.00
4" SLIP COUPLING
226|(GASKET) 50|SIGMA 6.50 325.00)MULTI 6.22 311.00|PTI 7.30 8.10 365.00)|GPK 7.25 362.50
227[4” GLUE COUPLING 50|SIGMA 1.25 62.50MULTI 1.22 61.00|PTI 1.40 1.60 70.00JGPK 1.40 70.00
228(4" SLIP 22 (GASKET) 50|SIGMA 5.00 250.00)MULTI 5.02 251.00|PTI 5.80 6.60 290.00)GPK 5.83 291.50
229(4" SLIP 45 (GASKET) 50|SIGMA 4.75 237.50|MULTI 5.04 252.00|PTI 5.80 6.60 290.00)GPK 5.83 291.50
4” SLIP STREET 22
230([(GASKET) 50|SIGMA 5.00 250.00)MULTI 4.79 239.50|PTI 5.50 6.20 275.00)GPK 5.46 273.00
231(4” GLUE STREET 22 50|SIGMA 2.60 130.00|MULTI 2.02 101.00)PTI 2.90 3.20 145.00)GPK 2.83 141.50
4" SLIP STREET 45
232|(GASKET) 50|SIGMA 4.75 237.50|MULTI 4.53 226.50|PTI 5.20 5.90 260.00)GPK 6.75 337.50
233|4" GLUE STREET 45 50|SIGMA 2.60 130.00JMULTI 1.84 92.00|PTI 2.90 3.20 145.00)GPK 2.62 131.00
234)|4X4 SDR 35 WYE 50|SIGMA 9.00 450.00|MULTI 8.68 434.00|PTI 10.00 11.35 500.00)GPK 10.05 502.50
235|SDR35 X SCH 40 REDUCER 40|SIGMA 4.00 160.00|MULTI 3.08 123.20|PTI 6.90|n/c 276.00|GPK 6.83 273.20
15X4 RUBBER TEE
236|(SADDLE) 20|SIGMA 29.00 580.00|FERNCO 28.50 570.00JPIPE CONX 25.00 31.00 500.00|FERNCO 35.63 712.60
15X4 RUBBER WYE
237|(SADDLE) 10|SIGMA 34.00 340.00]FERNCO 34.50 345.00]PIPE CONX 33.00 37.00 330.00JFERNCO 44.35 443.50
238|4" PVC PLUG 30|SIGMA 2.40 72.00fMULTI 2.52 75.60|PTI 2.80 3.20 84.00)GPK 1.58 47.40
239(6" PVC PLUG 20|SIGMA 3.70 74.00MULTI 3.88 77.60|PTI 4.30 4.90 86.00)GPK 7.38 147.60
240(8" PVC PLUG 20|SIGMA 13.18 263.60JMULTI 13.75 275.00)PTI 15.40 17.40 308.00)GPK 29.15 583.00
241|4” EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|SIGMA __[NO BID NO BID CHERNE 4.95 9.90|CHERNE 4.50 5.20 9.00|CHERNE 6.59 13.18
242)16” EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|SIGMA __[NO BID NO BID CHERNE 12.95 25.90)CHERNE 12.20 14.00 24.40|CHERNE 16.27 32.54
243|8" EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|SIGMA __[NO BID NO BID CHERNE 21.95 43.90|]CHERNE 23.00 26.60 46.00|]CHERNE 29.56 59.12
244110” EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|SIGMA __[NO BID NO BID CHERNE 195.95 391.90JCHERNE 208.00 227.00 416.00|]CHERNE 38.50 77.00
245|CAST IRON CLEAN OUT 40|SIGMA 78.00 3,120.00|SIGMA/ACC 71.00 2,840.00|SIGMA 69.00|n/c 2,760.00|SIGMA 78.05 3,122.00
246|CAST IRON CLEAN OUT LID 40|SIGMA 15.00 600.00JSIGMA/ACC 13.88 555.20|SIGMA 14.00{n/c 560.00]SIGMA 15.25 610.00
247(4” RUBBER CAP 50|MISSION 2.50 125.00|FERNCO 4.15 207.50]PIPE CONX 2.00 2.40 100.00JFERNCO 4.00 200.00
248(4" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 100|MISSION 3.50 350.00|FERNCO 3.74 374.00]PIPE CONX 2.90 3.50 290.00JFERNCO 3.29 329.00
249|4” PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 50{MISSION 3.50 175.00|FERNCO 3.74 187.00JPIPE CONX 2.90 3.50 145.00|FERNCO 3.29 164.50
250|6” PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 50|MISSION 7.50 375.00|FERNCO 8.50 425.00|PIPE CONX 6.40 7.60 320.00JFERNCO 7.00 350.00
251(6” PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 50|MISSION 7.50 375.00|FERNCO 8.50 425.00|PIPE CONX 6.40 7.60 320.00|FERNCO 7.00 350.00
252(8" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|MISSION 11.50 230.00JFERNCO 11.95 239.00JPIPE CONX 9.80 11.70 196.00|FERNCO 10.80 216.00
253|8” PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 20|MISSION 11.50 230.00JFERNCO 11.95 239.00JPIPE CONX 9.80 11.70 196.00|FERNCO 10.80 216.00
254(10" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|MISSION 17.00 340.00|FERNCO 17.25 345.00]PIPE CONX 13.20 17.60 264.00|FERNCO 16.23 324.60
255|12" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|MISSION 20.00 400.00]FERNCO 19.00 380.00JPIPE CONX 15.80 20.60 316.00|FERNCO 18.93 378.60
256|12" PVC-CLAY ADAPTER 10|MISSION 20.00 200.00JFERNCO 19.00 190.00JPIPE CONX 15.80 20.60 158.00|FERNCO 18.93 189.30
257|HTH GRANULAR 5 LBS. 50 14.00 700.00|FERNCO 16.75 837.50JHTH 12.00 14.30 600.00FERNCO 17.50 875.00
258|24” 300 LB MANHOLE LID 15|SIGMA 119.00 1,785.00| SIGMA/ACCUCAST 106.00 1,590.00|SIGMA 102.00(n/c 1,530.00|SIGMA 113.38 1,700.70
259|24” 400 LB MANHOLE LID 15|SIGMA 165.00 2,475.00| SIGMA/ACCUCAST 148.00 2,220.00|SIGMA 144.00n/c 2,160.00|SIGMA 156.98 2,354.70
260(24” 300 LB MANHOLE RING 15|SIGMA 134.00 2,010.00|SIGMA/ACCUCAST 119.78 1,796.70|SIGMA 114.00{n/c 1,710.00|SIGMA 126.75 1,901.25
261|24” 400 LB MANHOLE RING 15|SIGMA 202.00 3,030.00|SIGMA/ACCUCAST 181.30 2,719.50|SIGMA 176.00|n/c 2,640.00|SIGMA 191.00 2,865.00
24”300 LB MANHOLE RING
262|& LID 15|SIGMA 252.00 3,780.00|SIGMA/ACCUCAST 220.00 3,300.00|SIGMA 215.00|n/c 3,225.00|SIGMA 239.00 3,585.00
24”400 LB MANHOLE RING
263[& LID 15|SIGMA 368.00 5,520.00| SIGMA/ACCUCAST 322.00 4,830.00|SIGMA 320.00|n/c 4,800.00|SIGMA 348.00 5,220.00
JET PLUG CEMENT - 5
264|GALLON BUCKETS 300 32.00 9,600.00 27.75 8,325.00|SIGMA 28.00|n/c 8,400.00)]OCTO PLUG 36.50 10,950.00




SEWER MAINTENANCE
GROUP EXTENDED PRICE $49,993.10 $46,122.90 $45,224.40 $52,674.04

METER MAINTENANCE

265(1-1/2" METER FLANGE SET 750 22.00 16,500.00| CAMBRIDGE 52.13 39,097.50|MIDLAND 39.00 29,250.00]IMC 33.34 25,005.00
266[2" METER FLANGE SET 750 27.00 20,250.00|CAMBRIDGE 65.55 49,162.50|MIDLAND 40.00 30,000.00}IMC 36.40 27,300.00
¥ STRAIGHT METER
267|COUPLING 750! 4.64 3,480.00| CAMBRIDGE 4.25 3,187.50|FORD 4.70 3,525.00|FORD 4.46 3,345.00
1" STRAIGHT METER
268|COUPLING 3000 7.14 21,420.00|CAMBRIDGE 6.40 19,200.00|FORD 7.10 21,300.00|FORD 6.92 20,760.00
269|% “X7” METER RISER 100 48.00 4,800.00| CAMBRIDGE 49.73 4,973.00)FORD 42.90 4,290.00JFORD 45.45 4,545.00
270(% “X15” METER RISER 100 50.00 5,000.00|]CAMBRIDGE 52.97 5,297.00|FORD 46.90 4,690.00JFORD 49.34 4,934.00
271[1"X10” METER RISER 100 91.00 9,100.00|CAMBRIDGE 95.14 9,514.00|FORD 82.00 8,200.00|FORD 94.05 9,405.00
272[1"X12" METER RISER 100 93.00 9,300.00|CAMBRIDGE 97.30 9,730.00|FORD 84.00 8,400.00|FORD 95.96 9,596.00
273[1"X18” METER RISER 50 111.00 5,550.00|]CAMBRIDGE 126.00 6,300.00|FORD 100.00 5,000.00|FORD 111.97 5,598.50
274[1-1/2"X18” METER RISER 10 524.00 5,240.00]CAMBRIDGE 595.00 5,950.00|FORD 474.00 4,740.00JFORD 561.51 5,615.10

METER BOXES 5/8” TO 1” RESIDENTIAL PLASTIC METER BOX (DFW1814PLCIR) DFW PLASTIC OR
APPROVED EQUAL 1-1/2” TO 2” RESIDENTIAL METER PLASTIC METER BOX (DW2818PLCIR) DFW

PLASTIC OR APPROVED EQUAL 0.00 0.00
14"X18” PLASTIC METER
275|BOX 300|DFW 56.00 16,800.00|DFW 52.45 15,735.00|DFW 54.90 16,470.00|DFW 56.82 17,046.00
276[18"X24” METER BOX 200|DFW 202.00 40,400.00|DFW 190.88 38,176.00|DFW 199.00 39,800.00|DFW 206.50 41,300.00
2-1/2" FIRE HYDRANT
277|METER GASKET 1000 NO BID NO BID 1.25 1,250.00|EGW 1.50 1,500.00]JALL PRO 0.95 950.00
278[1-1/2" METER GASKETS 1000 1.75 1,750.00 0.54 540.00JEGW 0.55 550.00JALL PRO 1.05 1,050.00
279|2" METER GASKETS 1000 2.00 2,000.00 0.80 800.00JEGW 0.70 700.00JALL PRO 1.20 1,200.00
280(%" METER GASKETS 3000: 0.23 690.00 0.12 360.00JEGW 0.10 300.00JALL PRO 0.10 300.00
281|1” METER GASKETS 7000 0.23 1,610.00 0.15 1,050.00|EGW 0.15 1,050.00]JALL PRO 0.12 840.00
282|ADAPTER A34 300! 10.09 3,027.00| CAMBRIDGE 9.24 1,386.00]FORD 9.30 2,790.00|FORD 10.75 3,225.00
283(2-1/2" BOLT SET 200! NO BID NO BID 3.00 600.00JEGW 4.40 880.00JALL PRO 3.72 744.00

2" DOUBLE CHECK VALVE
WATTS 007M1QT2
(DOUBLE CHECK VALVE,
284|BACKFLOW PREVENT) 200|WATTS 180.00 36,000.00|WATTS 170.00 34,000.00|WATTS 189.00 37,800.00]WATTS 261.00 52,200.00

METER LIDS

DFW-18AMRBLSBD-LID —
SERIES F 12"X1-1/2" ID 11-
3/8”, OD 12-3/8” — Proread
285/ Plastic 2400|DFW 19.00 45,600.00|DFW 17.25 41,400.00|DFW 18.40 44,160.00|DFW 17.95 43,080.00

DFW-CILTR-LID SERIES F
20" X 1-1/2" ID 19-1/4", OD

286[20" — Proread Cast Iron 300|DFW 69.00 20,700.00|DFW 64.75 19,425.00|DFW 67.80 20,340.00|DFW 63.21 18,963.00
Fire Hydrant Meter Lock
287|Clamp — 3" 300|PERFOR. 110.00 33,000.00|DFW 77.45 23,235.00)|DFW 79.00 23,700.00)B20 192.75 57,825.00

Brooks Barrel Lock w/cap and
weather seal-hardened steel
288|"F" - P/N 8509718 300 8.00 2,400.00|BROOKS 3.30 990.00|BROOKS 3.55 1,065.00|BROOKS 3.98 1,194.00

METER MAINTENANCE
GROUP EXTENDED PRICE
SUBTOTAL= $304,617.00 $331,358.50 $310,500.00 $356,020.60)

$641,122.57
OVERALL TOTAL= $748,403.91 $624,189.40 $778,208.85

BID TAB STATEMENT

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF
A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY
INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.

THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH
ALL APPLICABLE LAWS. CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED|
TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT
TIME.




