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AKRON GROUP

1 UT-6-D90-LARH

Akron 6' - UT Shaft - D handle 90 

Degree - LA Rubbish Hook 2 $96.75 $193.50 110 $220.00 86 $172.00 $86.85 $173.70 87.5 $175.00

2 UT-6-DWH Akron 6' - UT Shaft - Drywall Hook 2 $81.00 $162.00 98 $196.00 67 $134.00 69 $138.00 69.9 $139.80

3 UT-3-D90-DWH

Akron 3' Drywall Hook - D-Handle 

90 Degree - UT Shaft 1 $76.71 $76.71 80 $80.00 85 $85.00 65.95 $65.95 67.05 $67.05

4 UT-8 Akron 8' Pike Pole UT Shaft - 1 $58.51 $58.51 68 $68.00 50 $50.00 49 $49.00 50 $50.00

5 Ut-12 Akron 12' Pike Pole UT Shaft - 1 $94.00 $94.00 84 $84.00 62.75 $62.75 63 $63.00 63.65 $63.65

6 PPB-51

Akron 51" Pinch Point Bar Model - 

PPB-51 1 $42.81 $42.81 38 $38.00 33.72 $33.72 33.49 $33.49 32.95 $32.95

7

Akron Hand Held Pitot Model HH-

Pitot with Heavy Duty Carry Case 1 $287.11 $287.11 278 $278.00 258.7 $258.70 256.75 $256.75 262.5 $262.50

8

Akron 2.5" NH Cap Gauge - 

Model CG-25 2 $181.71 $363.42 175 $350.00 169.75 $339.50 161.85 $323.70 165.9 $331.80

9

Akron Saberjet 1533 - 1.5" single 

shut-off with pistol grip and 15/16" 

tip 3 $677.65 $2,032.95 690 $2,070.00 669 $2,007.00 616.48 $1,849.44 654 $1,962.00

10

Akron Saberjet 1536 - 2.5" single 

shut-off with pistol grip and 1" tip 1 $735.12 $735.12 740 $740.00 602.5 $602.50 669.5 $669.50 710.25 $710.25

11

Akron Saberjet 1512 - 1" dual shut-

off with pistol grip and 5/8" tip 1 $664.71 $664.71 668 $668.00 657 $657.00 605.23 $605.23 642.05 $642.05

12 E-4750-PL / L5-20

Akron E-4750-PL, 750 watt Beta 

Head with Male 20amp twist lock 

240PG 2 $332.74 $665.48 310 $620.00 325 $650.00 296 $592.00 NO BID NO BID

13 Akron PG-5Y

Akron - Male 20A Twist Lock plug 

(part number 204 PG) / 12" 12 

gauge 3 wire / Female 15A 

connector (part number 212 CN) 2 $27.41 $54.82 21 $42.00 20.5 $41.00 21.28 $42.56 20.05 $40.10

14 Akron PG-2Y

Akron - Female 20A Twist Lock 

plug (part number 214 CN) / 12" 

12 gauge 3 wire / Male 15A plug 

(part number 202 PG) 2 $27.41 $54.82 22 $44.00 20.85 $41.70 21.6 $43.20 20.4 $40.80

15

Akron Pinch Point Bar Mounting 

Kit Model PPBH 1 $51.31 $51.31 46 $46.00 44.25 $44.25 43.18 $43.18 43.75 $43.75

16 Akron ECR - MT 2 $29.83 $59.66 27 $54.00 159.3 $318.60 25.5 $51.00 25.6 $51.20

17 Akron 42 1 $37.81 $37.81 35 $35.00 35.47 $35.47 34.66 $34.66 34.7 $34.70

AKRON GROUP TOTAL $5,634.74 $5,633.00 $5,533.19 $5,034.36 $4,647.60

ELKHART GROUP

18

Elkhart Model 105 Apparatus 

Elbow - 2.5" x 2.5" 6 $71.25 $427.50 74 $444.00 65.5 $393.00 62.42 $374.52 64.8 $388.80

19 Elkhart Model 310 8 $57.31 $458.48 55 $440.00 37.8 $302.40 46.79 $374.32 48.9 $391.20

20 Elkhart Model 470 3 $133.16 $399.48 55 $165.00 125.3 $375.90 122.55 $367.65 123.9 $371.70

21 Elkhart S454 3 $63.11 $189.33 63 $189.00 56.9 $170.70 54.84 $164.52 56.25 $168.75

22 Elkhart T-464 Spanner wrenches 4 $19.87 $79.48 21 $84.00 18.39 $73.56 17.91 $71.64 18.2 $72.80

23 Elk-o-Lite F464-B 2 $32.63 $65.26 33 $66.00 29.31 $58.62 27.94 $55.88 29 $58.00

24 228A

Elkhart 2 1/2" Model 228A Inline 

Pressure Gauge 1 $172.31 $172.31 180 $180.00 122.25 $122.25 154 $154.00 159.7 $159.70

25 B-100A

Elkhart 2.5" x 1.5" Light Weight 

Gated Wye 1 $219.64 $219.64 280 $280.00 205.15 $205.15 196 $196.00 202.85 $202.85

26 TSM30F Elkhart Select-o-Matic TSM30F 1 $549.11 $549.11 580 $580.00 518 $518.00 487.65 $487.65 726.15 $726.15

27 DB-275-GA

Elkhart 2.5" Inlet  x 1.5" Outlet with 

pistol grip 1 $366.31 $366.31 380 $380.00 344.8 $344.80 324.73 $324.73 340.9 $340.90

28 Elkhart ST190 Stacked Tips 1 $248.97 $248.97 274 $274.00 235.6 $235.60 231.11 $231.11 242.6 $242.60

29 Elkhart ST-195 Stacked tips 1 $253.47 $253.47 270 $270.00 237.9 $237.90 224.08 $224.08 235.25 $235.25
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30 Elkhart ST-194 Stacked tips 1 $368.97 $368.97 390 $390.00 345.4 $345.40 325.28 $325.28 341.5 $341.50

31 Elkhart Stinger Model 8297-51 1 $2,668.31 $2,668.31 2750 $2,750.00 2486.5 $2,486.50 2383.47 $2,383.47 2486.4 $2,486.40

32

Elkhart Select-o-Matic SM 1000 

with 2.5" swivel base 1 $873.31 $873.31 910 $910.00 823 $823.00 775 $775.00 813.65 $813.65

33 Elkhart 2 1/2" Model S320 6 $18.88 $113.28 18 $108.00 17.5 $105.00 16.72 $100.32 17.05 $102.30

34

Elkhart Model 653 2.5" Tri-Lok 

Holder 5 $75.61 $378.05 79 $395.00 72 $360.00 68.44 $342.20 70.45 $352.25

35

Elkhart Model L-653 1.5" Tri-Lok 

Holder 2 $71.96 $143.92 75 $150.00 68.5 $137.00 64.64 $129.28 66.5 $133.00

AKRON GROUP TOTAL $7,975.18 $8,055.00 $7,294.78 $7,081.65 $7,587.80

KOCHEK GROUP

36 (Kochek) SKE5T6R

Kochek, 6" FNST, Full Time 

Swivel, Rocker lug x 5" Storz, 30 

degree, Powder coated Black, 

Etched "Frisco FD" 2 $198.31 $396.62 221 $442.00 187.75 $375.50 265.65 $531.30 212.4 $424.80

37 (Kochek) S54R55

Kochek, 5" FNST x 5" Storz, 

Swivel, Powder Coated Black, 

Etched "Frisco FD" 1 $112.36 $112.36 119 $119.00 100.15 $100.15 141.75 $141.75 116.7 $116.70

38 (Kochek) 36R2525

Kochek, 2.5 x 2.5 double male, 

Powder Coated Black, Etched 

"Frisco FD" 3 $15.81 $47.43 23 $69.00 11.75 $35.25 22.05 $66.15 12.7 $38.10

39 (Kochek) 35R2525

Kochek, 2.5 x 2.5 double female, 

Powder Coated Black, Etched 

"Frisco FD" 3 $23.16 $69.48 23 $69.00 19.25 $57.75 26.25 $78.75 20.9 $62.70

40 (Kochek) SKE5T4R

Kochek, 30 degree, 4" NST 

female, full time swivel x 5" Storz - 

Rocker Lugs, Powder Coated 

Black, Etched "Frisco FD" 1 $203.31 $203.31 216 $216.00 181.5 $181.50 257.25 $257.25 205.35 $205.35

41 (Kochek) CC507

Kochek Blind Cap.  5" storz with 

chain,Powder Coated Black, 

Etched "Frisco FD" 5 $51.31 $256.55 50 $250.00 44.75 $223.75 58.5 $292.50 48.65 $243.25

42 (Kochek) S54L54

Kochek, 4" threaded - 5" Storz w/ 

Swivel, Powder Coated Black, 

Etched "Frisco FD" 2 $119.31 $238.62 126 $252.00 114.35 $228.70 151.2 $302.40 124.3 $248.60

43 (Kochek) S54R525

Kochek, 2.5" threaded - 5" Storz 

w/ Swivel, Powder Coated Black, 

Etched "Frisco FD" 2 $99.86 $199.72 104 $208.00 93.35 $186.70 122.85 $245.70 101.45 $202.90

44 (Kochek) 37R151

Kochek 1.5"-1" NST Reducer, 

Powder Coated Black, Etched 

"Frisco FD" 2 $17.31 $34.62 14 $28.00 12.21 $24.42 16.7 $33.40 13.3 $26.60

45 (Kochek) 37R454

Kochek 4.5" - 4"  Rigid NST, 

Powder Coated Black, Etched 

"Frisco FD" 1 $83.61 $83.61 82 $82.00 77.1 $77.10 96.6 $96.60 83.8 $83.80

46 (Kochek) 37R2515

Kochek 2.5" - 1.5", Powder 

Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD" 4 $18.11 $72.44 16 $64.00 13.35 $53.40 17.9 $71.60 14.5 $58.00

47 (Kochek) MF507 Kochek 5" Storz Mounting Plate 1 $20.83 $20.83 21 $21.00 17.45 $17.45 26 $26.00 19 $19.00

KOCHECK GROUP TOTAL $1,735.59 $1,820.00 1561.67 $2,143.40 $1,729.80

NUPLA GROUP

48 FP-6 Nupla Classic 6# Model FP6 - 36" 1 $63.42 $63.42 47 $47.00 43.9 $43.90 49.95 $49.95 43.4 $43.40

49 AP-6-36 Nupla Classic 6# Model AP6 - 36" 2 $64.91 $129.82 48 $96.00 37.5 $75.00 50.65 $101.30 45.1 $90.20

50 SP2D

Nupla Classic Square Point 

Shovel Model SP2D, # 2 Square 1 $40.31 $40.31 26 $26.00 25 $25.00 26.5 $26.50 NO BID NO BID

51 SS14

Nupla Classic Drain Spade Model 

SS14D, Hollow back 14" blade & 

27" D- Handle 1 $44.81 $44.81 30 $30.00 28.5 $28.50 27.48 $27.48 NO BID NO BID

NUPLA GROUP TOTAL $278.36 $199.00 $172.40 $205.23 $133.60

ZICO GROUP



52 SEH-3

Zico Model 4025 Quic-Grip Smoke 

Ejector Holder SEH-3 1 $148.61 $148.61 140 $140.00 138 $138.00 153.08 $153.08 137.15 $137.15

53

Zico 3099 Model ABCS - Axe/Bar 

carrying & shoulder straps 1 $63.41 $63.41 55 $55.00 54.65 $54.65 62.52 $62.52 54 $54.00

ZICO GROUP TOTAL $212.02 $195.00 $192.65 $215.60 $191.15

WEHR GROUP

54

Wehr Glassmaster with punch 

Model 10-97061 1 $188.71 $188.71 190 $190.00 134.3 $134.30 130 $130.00 183.3 $183.30

WEHR GROUP TOTAL $188.71 190 134.3 $130.00 $183.30

TURTLE PLASTIC GROUP

55

Turtle Plastics 4X4X18" Standard 

Cribbing Blocks with Rope Handle - 

Black 12 $38.25 $459.00 23 $276.00 21.28 $255.36 24.85 $298.20 21.05 $252.60

56

Turtle Plastics Standard Step 

Chocks with rope handle - Black 4 $161.28 $645.12 98 $392.00 175.17 $700.68 115 $460.00 92.8 $371.20

TURTLE PLASTICS GROUP 

TOTAL $1,104.12 $668.00 $956.04 $758.20 $623.80

SNAP TITE GROUP

57

Snap-Tite Steel storz wrenches 

with holder - model number FSPH-

1L 4 NO BID NO BID 60 $240.00 75.58 $302.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

58

Snap-Tite steel storz wrenches 

Model FSP-1L 2 NO BID NO BID 16 $32.00 15.11 $30.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SNAP TITE GROUP TOTAL NO BID $272.00 $332.54 NO BID

HARRINGTON GROUP

59

Harrington H400-50-50-25NH, 5 

way 5" x 5" 1 $1,574.00 $1,574.00 1550 $1,550.00 1319 $1,319.00 NO BID NO BID 1215.9 $1,215.90

60

5" Harrington HHR-2, 2 man hose 

roller 1 $157.31 $157.31 140 $140.00 128.19 $128.19 NO BID NO BID 119.3 $119.30

HARRINGTON GROUP TOTAL $1,731.31 $1,690.00 $1,447.19 NO BID $1,335.20

FIREQUIP GROUP

61 HS50YD

Firequip DJ 800 HFX 5" Supply 

Hose w/ Storz Coupling 100' 

sections 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 541 $5,410.00 530 $5,300.00 584.1 $5,841.00

62 HS50YB

Firequip DJ 800 HFX 5" Supply 

Hose w/ Storz Coupling 50' 

sections 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 338.82 $677.64 315.24 $630.48 342.35 $684.70

63 Hs50YA

Firequip DJ 800 HFX 5" Supply 

Hose w/ Storz Coupling 25' 

sections 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 228 $456.00 265.15 $530.30 287.9 $575.80

64 DJ25TB

Firequip DJ 800 Double Jacketed 

2.5" Tan 50' w/2.5" NST coupling 16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 145 $2,320.00 154 $2,464.00 166.5 $2,664.00

65 DJ800

Firequip DJ 800 Double Jacketed 

2.5" Tan 10' w/2.5" NST coupling 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.71 $129.42 69.4 $138.80 61.55 $123.10

66 DJ800

Firequip DJ 800 Double Jacketed 

1 3/4" Yellow 12.5' w/1.5" NST 

coupling 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 54.1 $108.20 55 $110.00 50.55 $101.10

67 DJ800

Firequip DJ 800 Double Jacketed 

1 3/4" Green 12.5' w/1.5" NST 

coupling 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 54.1 $108.20 55 $110.00 50.55 $101.10

68 CM17YB

Firequip DJ 1000 Combat, 1 3/4" 

Yellow w/blk stripe 50' w/1.5" NST 

coupling 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 217 $1,736.00 233.2 $1,865.60 253.3 $2,026.40



69 CM17GB

Firequip DJ 1000 Combat, 1 3/4" 

Green w/blk stripe 50' w/1.5" NST 

coupling 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 217 $1,736.00 233.2 $1,865.60 253.3 $2,026.40

70 SDH

Firequip Wildland Ultra Forestry 1" 

x 50' yellow w/ 1" couplings 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 76.47 $458.82 74.5 $447.00 75.85 $455.10

FIREQUIP GROUP TOTAL NO BID NO BID $13,140.28 $13,461.78 $14,598.70

TEMPEST GROUP

71

Tempest Direct Drive 18" fan with 

Honda 5.5 hp motor - Model DD 

18-H-5.5 1 NO BID NO BID 2250 $2,250.00 1875 $1,875.00 NO BID NO BID 1709 $1,709.00

TEMPEST GROUP TOTAL NO BID $2,250.00 1875 NO  BID $1,709.00

CMC GROUP

72 CMC #430203 CMC #2 - Red w/ shoulder straps 2 $47.66 $95.32 55 $110.00 NO BID NO BID 44.05 $88.10 36.2 $72.40

73 CMC #430105 CMC #1- Black 2 $23.83 $47.66 31 $62.00 NO BID NO BID 24.6 $49.20 19.95 $39.90

74 CMC #501501

Please remove life vest #472152 

from kit and replace with life vest 

#470149 2 $421.63 $843.26 420 $840.00 NO BID NO BID 447.83 $895.66 307.5 $615.00

75 CMC #202444 2 $119.77 $239.54 157 $314.00 NO BID NO BID 134 $268.00 110.1 $220.20

76 CMC #202446 2 $119.77 $239.54 157 $314.00 NO BID NO BID 134 $268.00 110.1 $220.20

77 CMC #202174 2 $186.74 $373.48 236 $472.00 NO BID NO BID 206 $412.00 169.15 $338.30

78 CMC #202175 2 $186.74 $373.48 236 $472.00 NO BID NO BID 206 $412.00 169.15 $338.30

CMC GROUP TOTAL
$2,212.28 $2,584.00 NO BID $2,392.96 $1,844.30

PAC MOUNT GROUP

79 Pac Handlelok P/N 1004 10 $41.68 $416.80 32 $320.00 NO BID NO BID 28 $280.00 27 $270.00

80 Pac Hookloks P/N 1001 10 $31.32 $313.20 25 $250.00 NO BID NO BID 22 $220.00 22.55 $225.50

81

Pac Super Adjustamount P/N 

1051 2 $54.87 $109.74 49 $98.00 NO BID NO BID 46 $92.00 44.5 $89.00

82 12" Pac Adjustamount P/N 1006-1 2 $11.25 $22.50 8 $16.00 NO BID NO BID 6.05 $12.10 6.05 $12.10

83 Jumbo Lok P/N 1070 5 $59.77 $298.85 53 $265.00 NO BID NO BID 49 $245.00 48.9 $244.50

84 Soft Mount P/N 1080 3 $102.43 $307.29 87 $261.00 NO BID NO BID 81 $243.00 80.8 $242.40

PAC GROUP TOTAL $1,468.38 $1,210.00 NO BID $1,092.10 $1,083.50

TALON MOUNT GROUP

85 92510Talon Talon helmet mounting system 4 NO BID NO BID 152 $608.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TALON GROUP TOTAL NO BID $608.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

86 15 lb CO2 Fire Extinguisher 1 $229.64 $229.64 245 $245.00 NO BID NO BID 250 $250.00 198 $198.00

87

Heavy Duty CO2 Extinguisher 

Mounting Bracket 1 $37.31 $37.31 35 $35.00 NO BID NO BID 39 $39.00 72.45 $72.45

88
20 lb Dry Chemical Fire 

Extinguisher 1 $131.00 $127.31 145 $145.00 NO BID NO BID 130 $130.00 90.8 $90.80

89

 Heavy Duty Dry Chemical 

Extinguisher Mounting Bracket 1 $37.31 $37.31 35 $35.00 NO BID NO BID 39 $39.00 35.95 $35.95

90
2.5 Gallon pressurized water can

1 $96.47 $96.47 105 $105.00 NO BID NO BID 130 $130.00 81.55 $81.55

91

Heavy Duty Mounting Bracket for 

2.5 Gallon Water  Can 1 $37.31 $37.31 35 $35.00 NO BID NO BID 39 $39.00 35.95 $35.95

EXTINGUISHER GROUP TOTAL $565.35 $600.00 NO BID $627.00 $514.70

MISC GROUP

93 Leather for 2.5" hose 1 $53.61 $53.61 50 $50.00 NO BID NO BID 49 $49.00 NO BID NO BID

94 Foam Bucket Wrench 1 $45.87 $45.87 12 $12.00 NO BID NO BID 12 $12.00 NO BID NO BID

95 22-000601 Paratech 36" 1 $197.59 $197.59 195 $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 180.9 $180.90



MISC GROUP TOTAL $297.07 $257.00 61 $180.90

$23,403.11 $26,231.00 $32,640.04 $33,203.28 $36,363.35

DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED

BID TAB STATEMENT
ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE 

RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.
THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS. CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT 
DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING 
TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.


