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Item # DESCRIPTION Unit Est Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended

ITEM DESCRIPTION

AIRWAY PRODUCTS  GROUP 1  

1

R.U.S.C.H. Endotracheal Tube uncuffed, 2.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 20 $3.83 $76.60 $3.44 $68.80 $3.89 $77.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid $1.52 $30.40

2

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed, 2.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 20 $3.83 $76.60 $2.94 $58.80 $3.89 $77.80 no bid no bid $2.84 56.8 $1.78 $35.60

3

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed, 3.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 20 $3.83 $76.60 $3.36 $67.20 $3.89 $77.80 no bid no bid $2.84 56.8 $1.52 $30.40

4

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed, 3.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 20 $3.83 $76.60 $3.21 $64.20 $3.89 $77.80 no bid no bid $2.84 56.8 $1.78 $35.60

5

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed , 4.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 20 $3.83 $76.60 $3.30 $66.00 $3.89 $77.80 no bid no bid $2.84 56.8 $1.78 $35.60

6

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed,4.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $3.83 $114.90 $3.37 $101.10 $3.89 $116.70 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $2.00 $60.00

7

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube uncuffed, 5.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $3.83 $114.90 $3.37 $101.10 $3.89 $116.70 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $1.85 $55.50

8

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 5.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $4.33 $129.90 $3.53 $105.90 $4.34 $130.20 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $2.67 $80.10

9

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 6.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $4.33 $129.90 $3.63 $108.90 $4.34 $130.20 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $2.67 $80.10

10

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 6.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $4.33 $129.90 $3.34 $100.20 $4.34 $130.20 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $2.68 $80.40

11

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed,7.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 60 $4.33 $259.80 $3.58 $214.80 $4.34 $260.40 no bid no bid $2.84 170.4 $2.89 $173.40

12

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed,7.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 60 $4.33 $259.80 $3.72 $223.20 $4.34 $260.40 no bid no bid $2.84 170.4 $2.91 $174.60

13

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 8.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 60 $4.33 $259.80 $3.71 $222.60 $4.34 $260.40 no bid no bid $2.84 170.4 $2.93 $175.80

14

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 8.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 60 $4.33 $259.80 $3.70 $222.00 $4.34 $260.40 no bid no bid $2.84 170.4 $2.94 $176.40

15

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 9.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 60 $4.33 $259.80 $3.72 $223.20 $4.34 $260.40 no bid no bid $2.84 170.4 $2.97 $178.20

16

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 9.5mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $4.33 $129.90 $3.93 $117.90 $4.34 $130.20 no bid no bid $2.84 85.2 $3.01 $90.30

17

R.U.S.C.H Endotracheal Tube cuffed, 10.0mm 

10/bx 5 bx/cs slick set EA 30 $4.33 $129.90 $4.33 $129.90 $4.34 $130.20 no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.04 $91.20

18

Laerdal Endotracheal tube holder adult 100/cs 

Thomas EA 30 $2.68 $80.40 $2.79 $83.70 $2.63 $78.90 $266.00 7980 $3.24 97.158 $2.63 $78.90

19

Laerdal Endotracheal tube holder pediatric/child 

100/cs Thomas EA 30 $2.68 $80.40 $2.79 $83.70 $2.63 $78.90 $266.00 7980 $3.24 97.158 $2.63 $78.90

20

Hudson RCI Airway infant size 5.5 55MM Cath 

guide 12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.83 $16.60 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

21

Hudson RCI Airway small child size 6 60MM Cath 

guide 12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.80 $16.00 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

22

Hudson RCI Airway child size 7 70MM Cath guide 

12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.89 $17.80 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

23

Hudson RCI Airway small adult size 8  80mm cath-

guide 12/bg 4bg/cs EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.86 $17.20 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

24

Hudson RCI Airway small/medium adult size 9 

90mm cath-guide 12/bx 4bg/cs EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.83 $16.60 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

25

Hudson RCI Airway medium adult size 10 100MM 

Cath guide 1167 12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.68 $13.60 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

26

Hudson RCI Airway oral adult size 11- 110 MM 

Cath-guide 12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.84 $16.80 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

27

Hudson RCI Airway large adult size 12 Cath guide 

12/BG 4BG/CS EA 20 $0.96 $19.20 $0.85 $17.00 $0.87 $17.40 no bid no bid $0.84 16.8 $0.72 $14.40

28 Hudson RCI Lifesaver Airway Kit #1173 EA 2 $27.57 $55.14 $0.85 $1.70 $25.39 $50.78 $26.22 52.44 $34.33 68.66 $19.99 $39.98

29

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 20 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.71 $34.20 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

30

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 22 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $2.21 $44.20 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

31

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 24 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.72 $34.40 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

32

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 26 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.72 $34.40 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

33

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 28 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.72 $34.40 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

34

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 30 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.71 $34.20 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

35

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 32 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.73 $34.60 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

36

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 34 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.76 $35.20 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

37

R.U.S.C.H Nasopharyngeal airway - npa - latex 

free robertazzi style 36 french 10/bx EA 20 $2.09 $41.80 $1.72 $34.40 $2.06 $41.20 $2.24 44.8 $1.99 39.8 $2.52 $50.40

38

Great Plains Ballistics BAAM Beck Arwy Airflow 

Monitor EA 20 $6.10 $122.00 $7.84 $156.80 $10.88 $217.60 $5.57 111.4 $7.27 145.454 $5.57 $111.40

39

Nellcor Carbon Dioxide (CO2) detector 24/cs easy 

cap EA 60 $9.60 $576.00 $9.05 $543.00 $9.15 $549.00 no bid no bid $8.82 529.2 $8.84 $530.40

40

Nellcor Carbon Dioxide (CO2) detector pediatric 

24/cs pedi-cap 40 $9.60 $384.00 $215.84 $8,633.60 $9.15 $366.00 no bid no bid $8.82 352.8 $8.84 $353.60

41

Wolfe Troy Medical EID intubation detection bulb 

style 20/cs EA 20 $4.23 $84.60 $4.18 $83.60 $4.43 $88.60 $68.89 1377.8 $1.18 23.6 $2.06 $41.20

42

R.U.S.C.H. Endotracheal tube introducer 10/bx 

9bx/cs flex-guide -latex free EA 30 $7.93 $237.90 $7.10 $213.00 $16.37 $491.10 $650.70 19521 no bid no bid $1.92 $57.60

43

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic macintosh 1 

infant focs EA 6 $74.00 $444.00 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

44

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic macintosh 2  

child focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

45

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic macintosh 3 

medium adult focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $77.85 $467.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

46

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic macintosh 4 

large adult focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

47

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic miller 0 premie 

focs EA 6 $74.00 $444.00 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

48

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic miller 1 infant 

focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

49

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic miller 2 child 

focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

50

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic miller 3 

medium adult focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $75.99 $455.94 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

51

R.U.S.C.H Laryngoscope fiberoptic miller 4 large 

adult focs EA 6 $68.55 $411.30 $74.35 $446.10 $80.15 $480.90 $39.43 236.58 no bid no bid $36.69 $220.14

52 Laryngoscope handle standard medium c adult EA 6 $8.93 $53.58 $8.46 $50.76 $9.26 $55.56 $51.78 310.68 $15.34 92.0454 $12.82 $76.92

53 Forceps Magill intubating adult 9.75 in 12/bx EA 6 $3.63 $21.78 $3.44 $20.64 $5.29 $31.74 $38.76 232.56 $2.99 17.94 $5.43 $32.58

54 Forceps Magill intubating child 8 in 12/bx EA 6 $3.63 $21.78 $3.42 $20.52 $5.29 $31.74 $35.40 212.4 $2.99 17.94 $5.43 $32.58

55 Bite Stik Plastic Disposable EA 20 $0.32 $6.40 $0.19 $3.80 $0.30 $6.00 $0.23 4.6 $0.44 8.864 $0.34 $6.80

56

R.U.S.C.H Stylette slick  disposable adult large 

7.0 to 10.0 25/bx EA 20 $3.07 $61.40 $2.50 $50.00 $2.84 $56.80 $67.00 1340 $2.34 46.818 $2.53 $50.60

57

R.U.S.C.H Stylette disposable pediatric medium 

4.0 to 6.5 25/bx slick EA 20 $3.07 $61.40 $2.43 $48.60 $2.84 $56.80 $67.00 1340 $2.50 50 $2.53 $50.60

58

R.U.S.C.H Stylette disposable neonate small 2.0 

to 3.5 25/bx slick EA 20 $3.07 $61.40 $2.53 $50.60 $2.84 $56.80 no bid no bid $1.95 39.09 $2.53 $50.60
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59 King Systems Corp King Airway LTS-D     Size 3 EA 30 $39.00 $1,170.00 $31.54 $946.20 $35.96 $1,078.80 no bid no bid $28.95 868.5 no bid no bid

60 King Systems Corp King Airway LTS-D     Size 4 EA 30 $39.00 $1,170.00 $30.92 $927.60 $35.96 $1,078.80 no bid no bid $28.95 868.5 no bid no bid

61 King Systems Corp King Airway LTS-D     Size 5 EA 30 $39.00 $1,170.00 $32.26 $967.80 $35.96 $1,078.80 no bid no bid $28.95 868.5 no bid no bid

62

Bemis Suction canister disposable rigid green top 

1200cc 48/cs hi-flow EA 100 $3.29 $329.00 $2.49 $249.00 $2.41 $241.00 $127.20 12720 $4.44 444 $2.79 $279.00 look at moore

63 Kendall Connector Tubing 6'x1/4 #154 " EA 100 $0.82 $82.00 $1.26 $126.00 $0.80 $80.00 no bid no bid $0.79 79 $0.77 $77.00

64 Kendall Yankauer Flex Suction w/Vent EA 100 $0.84 $84.00 $2.50 $250.00 $1.95 $195.00 no bid no bid $0.19 19.32 $0.39 $39.00

65 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 6Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.33 $6.60 $0.42 $8.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.43 $8.60

66 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 8Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.33 $6.60 $0.42 $8.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.43 $8.60

67 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 10Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.33 $6.60 $0.36 $7.20 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.38 $7.60

68 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 12Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.33 $6.60 $0.37 $7.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.38 $7.60

69 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 14Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.34 $6.80 $0.37 $7.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.35 $7.00

70 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 16Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.34 $6.80 $0.37 $7.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.36 $7.20

71 Kendall Cath Suction Coil 18Fr Safe-T EA 20 $0.26 $5.20 $0.36 $7.20 $0.37 $7.40 $0.43 8.6 $0.42 8.4 $0.37 $7.40

72 V Vac Starter Kit 985000 EA 2 $72.58 $145.16 $66.60 $133.20 $68.34 $136.68 $67.67 135.34 $80.17 160.341 $69.98 $139.96

73 V-vac Cartridge EA 6 $17.87 $107.22 $15.74 $94.44 $16.83 $100.98 $16.67 100.02 $19.20 115.227 $17.14 $102.84

74

Esophageal obturator airway  complete kit 25/cs - 

latex free EA 16 $35.86 $573.76 $34.44 $551.04 $56.12 $897.92 no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.01 $32.16

75

AMBU Spur II adult bvm w/ medium adult mask 

12/cs EA 120 $8.54 $1,024.80 $9.09 $1,090.80 $9.96 $1,195.20 $9.10 1092 $10.55 1265.46 $9.14 $1,096.80

76

AMBU Spur II pediatric bvm  w/ toddler mask 

12/cs EA 80 $9.76 $780.80 $12.05 $964.00 $13.11 $1,048.80 $12.20 976 $13.55 1083.64 $12.13 $970.40

77 AMBU Spur II infant bvm w/ neonate mask 12/cs EA 60 $9.76 $585.60 $12.05 $723.00 $13.11 $786.60 $12.20 732 $13.58 814.77 $12.13 $727.80

78 Laerdal LSU portable suction unit EA 2 $735.35 $1,470.70 $705.61 $1,411.22 $708.72 $1,417.44 $686.14 1372.28 $805.36 1610.7272 $693.82 $1,387.64

79 Mask High Concentration #1059 Case 24 $51.50 $1,236.00 $59.50 $1,428.00 $53.30 $1,279.20 $51.00 1224 $1.13 27.12 $48.00 $1,152.00

80 Pediatric Non-Rbrth Mask #1058 Case 24 $58.00 $1,392.00 $95.00 $2,280.00 $59.88 $1,437.12 $61.00 1464 $1.50 36 $51.50 $1,236.00

81 Nasal Cannula Clear #1104     Case 12 $16.50 $198.00 $26.00 $312.00 $19.46 $233.52 $18.00 216 $0.43 5.1816 $20.50 $246.00

82 Oxygen, nasal cannula, Pedi Case 12 $24.50 $294.00 $26.00 $312.00 $16.47 $197.64 no bid no bid $0.41 4.92 $44.50 $534.00

83

Cardinal Health Nebulizer with baffled tee adapter, 

7´ oxygen tubing with blue rigid tip, mouthpiece 

and 6” flextube Case 6 $42.50 $255.00 $53.50 $321.00 $47.60 $285.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid $52.64 $315.84

84 Nebulizer with elongated Adult mask Case 6 $47.50 $285.00 $54.50 $327.00 $41.17 $247.02 no bid no bid $45.50 273 $70.50 $423.00

85 Demand valve with hose and mask 40 lpm lsp EA 2 $231.37 $462.74 $216.51 $433.02 $316.88 $633.76 no bid no bid $204.19 408.3864 no bid no bid

86 6" Sterile Tongue Depressors EA 24 $0.02 $0.58 no bid no bid $0.03 $0.66 no bid no bid $0.02 0.48 $0.03 $0.72

87 Hudson RCI Humidifier prefilled 12/cs 002620 EA 24 $1.93 $46.32 $2.03 $48.72 $2.28 $54.72 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

88 Oxygen Flowmeter/Ohio EA 2 $31.75 $63.50 $36.45 $72.90 $40.18 $80.36 no bid no bid $33.75 67.5 no bid no bid

89 Mask Single Use Child EA 24 $1.83 $43.92 $1.83 $43.92 $1.50 $36.00 $1.88 45.12 $2.45 58.8 $1.03 $24.72

90 R.U.S.C.H Mask Single Use W/Valve Sml EA 24 $1.83 $43.92 $1.83 $43.92 $1.69 $40.56 $1.88 45.12 $2.45 58.8 $1.55 $37.20

91 R.U.S.C.H Mask Single Use W/Valve Med EA 24 $1.83 $43.92 $1.97 $47.28 $1.69 $40.56 $1.88 45.12 $2.45 58.8 $1.55 $37.20

92 R.U.S.C.H Mask Single Use W/Valve Lrg  EA 24 $1.83 $43.92 $1.88 $45.12 $1.69 $40.56 $1.88 45.12 $2.45 58.8 $1.55 $37.20

93 Thermo Cylinder Handwheel 002865 EA 24 $8.80 $211.20 $11.15 $267.60 $12.52 $300.48 $10.07 241.68 $6.50 156 no bid no bid

94 Hudson RCI Mask Harness Univ 15920 DS EA 50 $3.10 $155.00 $2.86 $143.00 $2.94 $147.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

95 Barbed fitting plastic  50/cs EA 50 $0.43 $21.50 $9.51 $475.50 $0.38 $19.00 $23.50 1175 $0.44 22 $0.34 $17.00

96

Adapter Ohmeda to 1/8 in male national pipe 

thread - npt- 2101 EA 2 $12.20 $24.40 $11.74 $23.48 $12.35 $24.70 $9.18 18.36 $14.50 29 $11.19 $22.38

97 Flowmeter Ohmeda qc chrome plated 0-15 lpm EA 2 $35.92 $71.84 $38.19 $76.38 $33.31 $66.62 $39.80 79.6 $14.50 29 no bid no bid

98 Ohio male x diss male EA 2 $15.59 $31.18 $16.00 $32.00 $15.97 $31.94 no bid no bid $15.25 30.5 $14.36 $28.72

99 Flowmeter dial 0-25 lpm EA 2 $36.77 $73.54 $39.00 $78.00 $50.18 $100.36 $43.22 86.44 $34.26 68.52 no bid no bid

100 Regulator 2 diss 1 barb 0-25 l EA 6 $64.40 $386.40 $85.82 $514.92 $46.09 $276.54 no bid no bid $61.36 368.1816 no bid no bid

Group 1 Subtotal $22,879.70 $32,544.42 $24,593.36 $64,868.70 $13,687.50 $14,714.50

INTRAVENOUS GROUP 2

101 Tourniquet PF Latex Free EA 2000 $0.10 $202.40 $0.30 $600.00 $0.07 $132.00 no bid no bid $0.09 179 $0.09 $180.00

102

Kendall Alcohol prep pads non sterile medium 

200/bx 10bx/cs Box 20 $1.29 $25.80 $1.14 $22.80 $1.27 $25.40 no bid no bid $1.48 29.546 $1.17 $23.40

103 Lancets 200/bx 6bx/cs accu-chek safe-t-pro EA 12 $0.25 $3.00 $0.23 $2.76 $0.25 $3.00 no bid no bid $0.27 3.294 $0.39 $4.68

104 Bayer Ascensia Contour POC Tst Strip Box 48 $20.74 $995.52 $20.54 $985.92 $20.73 $995.04 $18.89 906.72 $23.85 1144.9104 $21.91 $1,051.68

105 Bayer Ascensia Contour Monitoring System EA 6 $0.02 $0.12 $21.64 $129.84 $0.00 $0.00 $16.67 100.02 $7.90 47.3862 $0.00 $0.00

106 Bayer Ascensia Contour Normal Control Solution EA 24 $3.66 $87.84 $3.42 $82.08 $3.75 $90.00 $4.18 100.32 $5.68 136.3632 $4.31 $103.44

107 B-Braun Ultrasite IV Set #US1160 Case 48 $75.00 $3,600.00 $76.50 $3,672.00 $69.31 $3,326.88 $70.00 3360 $142.05 6818.4 $68.54 $3,289.92

108 B-Braun Ultrasite IV Set   60 Drop Case 2 $91.00 $182.00 $174.50 $349.00 $81.93 $163.86 no bid no bid no bid no bid $191.67 $383.34

109 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 14Gx11/4 Str" Box 6 $73.50 $441.00 $83.16 $498.96 $77.12 $462.72 $99.51 597.06 $75.85 455.1 $81.46 $488.76

110 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 16Gx11/4 Str" Box 6 $73.50 $441.00 $81.66 $489.96 $77.12 $462.72 $101.11 606.66 $75.85 455.1 $81.46 $488.76

111 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 18Gx11/4 Str" Box 24 $73.50 $1,764.00 $85.00 $2,040.00 $77.12 $1,850.88 $101.11 2426.64 $75.85 1820.4 $81.46 $1,955.04

112 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 20Gx1 Str   Box 24 $73.50 $1,764.00 $85.33 $2,047.92 $77.12 $1,850.88 $101.11 2426.64 $75.85 1820.4 $81.46 $1,955.04

113 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 22Gx1 Str Box 6 $73.50 $441.00 $80.50 $483.00 $77.12 $462.72 $101.11 606.66 $75.85 455.1 $81.46 $488.76

114 B-Braun Introcan IV Cath 24Gx3/4 Str Box 6 $73.50 $441.00 $81.69 $490.14 $77.12 $462.72 $101.11 606.66 $75.85 455.1 $81.46 $488.76

115

B-Braun Catheter intravenous (iv) safety 14 gauge 

x 1.25 in 50/bx 4bx/cs protectiv plus Box 6 $92.50 $555.00 $110.00 $660.00 $88.63 $531.78 $101.39 608.34 $82.39 494.3184 $85.83 $514.98

116

B-Braun Catheter intravenous (iv) 16 gauge x 1.25 

in 50/bx 4bx/cs protectiv plus Box 6 $92.50 $555.00 $110.00 $660.00 $88.63 $531.78 $86.67 520.02 $82.39 494.3184 $85.83 $514.98

117

B-Braun Catheter intravenous (iv) 18 gauge x 1.25 

in 50/bx 4bx/cs protectiv plus Box 6 $92.50 $555.00 $110.00 $660.00 $88.63 $531.78 $86.67 520.02 $82.39 494.3184 $85.83 $514.98

118

B-Braun Catheter intravenous (iv) 20 gauge x 1 in 

50/bx 4bx/cs protectiv plus Box 6 $92.50 $555.00 $110.00 $660.00 $88.63 $531.78 $86.67 520.02 $82.39 494.3184 $85.83 $514.98

119 Surflo IV Cath 14x2 1451CA Box 2 $35.50 $71.00 $35.50 $71.00 $40.05 $80.10 $38.61 77.22 $27.84 55.6818 $37.76 $75.52

120 Braun Surecan Huber Ndl 20G x 3/4   Case 3 $577.00 $1,731.00 $107.98 $323.94 $81.13 $243.39 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

121 Kendall Needle Intraosseous 16G EA 6 $37.04 $222.24 $10.48 $62.88 $11.59 $69.54 $11.19 67.14 $11.19 67.14 $10.96 $65.76

122 B-D 18G x 1 1/2"   Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $6.00 $12.00 $5.88 $11.76 $5.70 11.4 $6.00 12 no bid no bid

123 B-D 18G x 1" Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $6.00 $12.00 $5.29 $10.58 $5.11 10.22 $6.00 12 no bid no bid

124 B-D 19G x 1 1/2" Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 no bid no bid $5.88 $11.76 no bid no bid $6.00 12 no bid no bid

125 B-D 20G x 1 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $4.59 $9.18 no bid no bid $5.88 $11.76 no bid no bid $6.00 12 no bid no bid

126 B-D 20G x 1"  Hypodermic needles 100/ Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 no bid no bid $5.88 $11.76 no bid no bid $6.00 12 no bid no bid

127 B-D 21G x 1 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $4.59 $9.18 no bid no bid $6.00 $12.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

128 B-D 21G x 1"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $5.71 $11.42 $6.00 $12.00 $5.29 $10.58 $5.11 10.22 $5.00 10 no bid no bid

129 B-D 22G x 1 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $4.59 $9.18 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

130 B-D 22G x 1"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

131 B-D 23G x 1"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

132 B-D 25G x 1 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

133 B-D 25G x 1"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

134 B-D 25G x 5/8"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

135 B-D 26G x 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $3.28 $6.56 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

136 B-D 27G x 1 1/4"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 $12.20 $24.40 $12.00 $24.00 $11.76 $23.52 $11.36 22.72 $12.00 24 no bid no bid

137 B-D 27G x 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 4.59 9.18 $8.00 $16.00 $7.88 $15.76 $7.61 15.22 $8.00 16 no bid no bid

138 B-D 30G x 1/2"  Hypodermic needles 100/Box EA 2 no bid no bid $8.00 $16.00 $2.67 $5.34 $25.80 51.6 $0.27 0.5436 no bid no bid

139 B-D Luer-Lok Tip 1cc  100/Box EA 2 37.3 74.6 no bid no bid $0.12 $0.23 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

140 B-D Luer-Lok Tip 3cc 100/Box EA 2 5.36 10.72 no bid no bid $7.27 $14.54 no bid no bid $0.07 0.148 no bid no bid

141 B-D Luer-Lok Tip 5cc 100/Box EA 2 8.17 16.34 no bid no bid $13.28 $26.56 no bid no bid $0.13 0.2556 no bid no bid

142 B-D Luer-Lok Tip 10cc 100/Box EA 4 11.14 44.56 no bid no bid $15.39 $61.56 no bid no bid $0.16 0.6264 no bid no bid

143 B-D Luer-Lok Tip 20cc 40/Box EA 2 0.35 0.7 $12.00 $24.00 $11.52 $23.04 $11.14 22.28 $0.29 0.5866 no bid no bid

144 B-D Luer Lock 30-35cc 50/Box EA 2 13.35 26.7 $13.50 $27.00 $13.17 $26.34 no bid no bid $0.34 0.6706 no bid no bid

145 B-D Luer Lock 50-60cc 25/Box EA 2 10.92 21.84 no bid no bid $21.60 $43.20 no bid no bid $0.88 1.7588 no bid no bid

146 B-D Syr & Ndl 1cc 25g x 5/8 Box 2 12 24 $16.00 $32.00 $15.88 $31.76 $15.34 30.68 $0.16 0.3232 $15.07 $30.14

147 B-D Syr & Ndl 3cc 18x11/2 9580 Box 6 9.53 57.18 $9.50 $57.00 $9.41 $56.46 $9.09 54.54 $0.10 0.5748 no bid no bid

148 B-D Syr & Ndl 5cc 20x1 9634 Box 2 17.15 34.3 $18.00 $36.00 $18.23 $36.46 $17.61 35.22 $0.19 0.3712 no bid no bid

149 B-D Blunt Plastic Cannula 303345 Box 2 25 50 $21.69 $43.38 $24.11 $48.22 $22.78 45.56 $0.25 0.491 $23.18 $46.36

150

Wolfe Troy Medical Mad Nasal w/o Syringe 

Mad300 Box 6 225 1350 no bid no bid $60.41 $362.46 $52.50 315 $2.68 16.0908 $233.00 $1,398.00

151 Sodium Chloride 0.9%, 1000ml bags EA 2000 0.91 1820 $1.50 $3,000.00 $1.16 $2,320.00 $1.90 3800 no bid no bid $1.09 $2,180.00
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152 Sodium Chloride 0.9%, 500ml bags EA 500 0.84 420 $1.50 $750.00 $1.00 $500.00 $1.63 815 no bid no bid $1.01 $505.00

153

Con-Med Intravenous (iv) dressing transparent 

adult 100/bx 5bx/cs veni-gard EA 12 35.77 429.24 no bid no bid $37.50 $450.00 $227.25 2727.012 $34.09 409.08 $0.38 $4.55

154

Con-Med Intravenous (IV) dressing transparent 

junior 100/BX 5BX/CS VENI-GARD EA 6 32.15 192.9 no bid no bid $35.22 $211.32 $227.25 1363.506 $38.25 229.5 $0.34 $2.07

155 Baxter Stopcock 3Way/Ext 8 Tube  EA 12 2.4 28.8 no bid no bid $3.14 $37.68 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

156 Chest decompression set EA 6 17.03 102.18 no bid no bid $29.95 $179.70 no bid no bid $30.13 180.75 no bid no bid

SUBTOTAL FOR INTRAVENOUS 

GROUP 2 $19,475.12 $19,165.58 $17,473.64 $23,486.86 $16,983.97 $17,268.90

MONITORING AND DIAGNOSTIC PRODUCTS  

GROUP 3

157

Ambu Blue Sensor Electrodes foam blue 50/pk 

20pk/bx midi sp-00-s EA 500 10.86 5430 $11.50 $5,750.00 $0.25 $124.40 no bid no bid $0.27 133.5 $0.23 $113.00

158 Kendall Medi Trace 135 pediatric electrodes EA 24 0.85 20.4 $0.15 $3.60 $0.17 $4.00 no bid no bid $0.81 19.44 $0.16 $3.79

159

Oridion Microstream Filterline set adult/pediatric 

25/bx EA 100 6.79 679 $12.61 $1,261.00 $11.09 $1,109.00 $200.00 20000.1 $7.04 704 no bid no bid

160

Oridion Microstream Filterline h set infant/neonate 

25/bx EA 40 11.62 464.8 $13.46 $538.40 $21.59 $863.60 $325.00 13000 $15.11 604.544 no bid no bid

161

Oridion Microstream Smart Capnoline plus adult 

25/CS EA 250 8.44 2110 $10.97 $2,742.50 $12.48 $3,120.00 $310.00 77500 $8.27 2068.2 no bid no bid

162 Nellcor Sensor adult 24/CS oxisensor II 18 in cable EA 48 13.77 660.96 $12.62 $605.76 $13.59 $652.32 no bid no bid no bid no bid $12.99 $623.52

163

Nellcor Sensor 36 in cable adult 24/cs oxisensor II 

d25l EA 24 15.51 372.24 $13.89 $333.36 $14.95 $358.80 $308.16 7395.84 $12.24 293.76 $14.28 $342.72

164 Nellcor Sensor pediatric 24/cs oxisensor II EA 144 13.77 1982.88 $13.20 $1,900.80 $13.59 $1,956.96 $308.16 44375.04 $13.14 1891.6416 $12.99 $1,870.56

165 Nellcor Sensor infant 24/cs oxisensor II EA 144 17.9 2577.6 $17.16 $2,471.04 $17.67 $2,544.48 $400.56 57680.64 $17.06 2456.928 $16.89 $2,432.16

166 Blood Pressure Kit Systm 5 Nvy EA 4 87.15 348.6 $89.44 $357.76 $118.02 $472.08 $79.41 317.64 $59.09 236.3636 $72.78 $291.12

167 Hand Held Oximeter BCI 3301 EA 2 390.99 781.98 $352.65 $705.30 $415.80 $831.60 $364.66 729.32 $401.63 803.25 $397.11 $794.22

168 Hand Held Oximeter Carryng Case-BCI 3301 EA 2 44.48 88.96 $41.67 $83.34 $46.20 $92.40 $40.52 81.04 $36.75 73.5 $43.63 $87.26

169 Pen Light-Diagnostic-Disp  EA 100 0.69 69 $0.63 $63.00 $0.57 $57.00 no bid no bid $0.82 81.83 $0.64 $64.00

170 Adtemp II Digital Therm 413 EA 6 3.61 21.66 $3.18 $19.08 $3.36 $20.16 $2.38 14.28 $4.75 28.5 $3.76 $22.56

171 Thermometer Probe Cvr Digital Box 6 1.86 11.16 $2.18 $13.08 $2.08 $12.48 $1.55 9.3 $1.68 10.0908 $2.42 $14.52

172 Braun Thermoscan Pro4000 EA 2 180.13 360.26 $158.43 $316.86 $175.83 $351.66 $164.11 328.22 $153.41 306.8182 $165.96 $331.92

173 Braun Probe Cover f/Braun ThermoScan Pkg/200 12 13.37 160.44 $12.15 $145.80 $13.20 $158.40 $12.47 149.64 $14.41 172.9092 $12.62 $151.44

174 ADC Cardiology Stethoscope Blk  EA 12 51.02 612.24 $55.30 $663.60 $48.24 $578.88 $48.52 582.24 $67.91 814.9092 $53.72 $644.64

175 ADC Sphygmomanometer Adult   EA 6 11.77 70.62 $6.23 $37.38 $7.15 $42.90 no bid no bid $5.99 35.94 $5.51 $33.06

176 ADC Sphygmomanometer Child EA 6 14.94 89.64 $6.91 $41.46 $11.75 $70.50 no bid no bid $5.99 35.94 $7.29 $43.74

177 ADC Sphygmomanometer Infant EA 6 14.58 87.48 $7.04 $42.24 $11.75 $70.50 no bid no bid $5.99 35.94 $7.29 $43.74

178 Stethoscope dualhead tEAing non chill black 671 EA 2 9.19 18.38 $9.29 $18.58 $9.48 $18.96 $5.50 11 $12.70 25.4 $10.04 $20.08

179

Sensor reusable finger clip adult nellcor 

durasensor ds100a EA 6 125.61 753.66 $117.75 $706.50 $121.17 $727.02 $114.44 686.64 $117.05 702.273 $115.73 $694.38

180 Cable extension 4 ft for nellcor pulse oximeter ec-4 EA 6 42.71 256.26 $38.28 $229.68 $41.20 $247.20 no bid no bid $43.45 260.7 $40.24 $241.44

181

Masimo RAD 57C portable Co-Oximeter 2711-

25003 EA 2 4115.86 8231.72 no bid no bid $472.58 $945.16 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

182

Masimo Rainbow DCIP-DC3 Pediatric Sensor for 

RAD 57 2712-06916 EA 2 469.52 939.04 no bid no bid $180.35 $360.70 no bid no bid $238.64 477.28 no bid no bid

SUB TOTAL FOR 

MONITORING & 

DIAGNOSTIC GROUP 3 $27,198.98 $19,050.12 $15,791.16 $222,860.94 $12,273.66 $8,863.87

AWARDED TOTAL $8,321.72 $1,884.74 $10,981.47

WOUND CARE PRODUCTS GROUP 4 

183 R.U.S.C.H Chest seal 10/bx Asherman 849100 EA 40 9.48 379.2 $8.28 $331.20 $9.41 $376.40 $8.91 356.4 $8.86 354.544 no bid no bid

184 Coverlet 1x3 #231 EA 200 3.65 730 $0.02 $4.00 $0.04 $8.54 $4.00 800 $3.69 738.64 no bid no bid

185 Patch Coverlet bandages100/box EA 2 0.0331 0.0662 no bid no bid $0.05 $0.10 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

186 Strip Coverlet bandages 100/box EA 2 0.0378 0.0756 no bid no bid $0.04 $0.09 $4.00 8 no bid no bid no bid no bid

187 Knuckle Coverlet bandages 100/box EA 2 0.0434 0.0868 no bid no bid $0.07 $0.13 $6.12 12.24 no bid no bid no bid no bid

188 Fingertip Coverlet Band, box/100 EA 2 0.0434 0.0868 no bid no bid $0.07 $0.14 $6.45 12.9 no bid no bid no bid no bid

189 Oval Coverlet bandages 100/box EA 2 0.0434 0.0868 no bid no bid $0.04 $0.09 $4.10 8.2 no bid no bid no bid no bid

190 Large Digit Coverlet bandages 50/box EA 2 0.0434 0.0868 no bid no bid $0.13 $0.26 $6.15 12.3 no bid no bid no bid no bid

191 Sesame Street Band-Aid, box/100 Box 2 4.36 8.72 no bid no bid $3.88 $7.76 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

192 Abdominal Pad Dermacea 5 X 9"" EA 100 0.145 14.5 $0.13 $13.00 $0.14 $14.00 no bid no bid $0.14 13.5 no bid no bid

193 Abdominal Pad Dermacea 8x10" " EA 100 0.2016 20.16 $0.15 $15.00 $0.19 $19.00 no bid no bid $0.19 18.75 no bid no bid

194 Multi-Trauma Dressing 10 x 30 EA 100 1 100 $0.89 $89.00 $0.93 $93.00 $1.47 147 $0.94 94 no bid no bid

195 Rolled Gauze 3 Wvn 2ply Ster " Pkg/12 24 2.84 68.16 $4.31 $103.44 $5.08 $121.92 $6.19 148.56 $2.82 67.6368 no bid no bid

196 Rolled Gauze 4 Wvn 2ply Ster " Pkg/12 24 2.97 71.28 $5.12 $122.88 $5.81 $139.44 $7.27 174.48 $3.02 72.5448 no bid no bid

197 Rolled Gauze 6 Wvn 2ply Ster " Pkg/6 24 2.97 71.28 $5.04 $120.96 $4.75 $114.00 $6.19 148.56 $3.14 75.2736 no bid no bid

198 Kerlix Rolls 4" x 4.1", case/100 Case 2 58 116 $119.00 $238.00 $127.90 $255.80 $122.20 244.4 $78.00 156 no bid no bid

199 Curity Gz Pad 4x4 Ster 6309  Box 40 15.64 625.6 $14.00 $560.00 $15.08 $603.20 $14.25 570 $16.19 647.728 no bid no bid

200 Gauze Sponges in Tray 4" x 4", 10 per Tray EA 20 0.68 13.6 $0.06 $1.20 $0.06 $1.28 $0.64 12.8 $0.51 10.228 no bid no bid

201 Vaseline Gauze Strips 3x9 Box 6 32.5 195 $28.50 $171.00 $7.35 $44.10 $29.17 175.02 $0.60 3.5802 no bid no bid

202 Triangular Bandage #4910 EA 200 0.21 42 $0.22 $44.00 $0.32 $64.00 no bid no bid $0.33 65.16 no bid no bid

203 Roehampton Burn Sheet 60x96" Ster #312  " EA 24 5.36 128.64 $9.13 $219.12 $6.45 $154.80 $5.75 138 $6.85 164.4 no bid no bid

204 3M Dermicel Cloth Tape 1" x 10", box/12 Box 12 7.68 92.16 $7.52 $90.24 $7.93 $95.16 no bid no bid $7.91 94.9092 no bid no bid

205 3M Dermicel Cloth Tape 2" x 10", box/6 Box 12 7.68 92.16 $7.52 $90.24 $7.93 $95.16 no bid no bid $7.91 94.9092 no bid no bid

206 3M Dermicel Cloth Tape 1/2" x 10", box/12 Box 12 7.68 92.16 $7.52 $90.24 $3.97 $47.58 no bid no bid $7.91 94.9092 no bid no bid

207 3M Transpore Tape 1" x 10 Yards, box/12 Box 12 14.15 169.8 $9.86 $118.32 $10.09 $121.08 $12.89 154.68 $10.01 120.108 no bid no bid

208 Padded Board Splint 2" x 6" EA 24 0.59 14.16 $0.49 $11.76 $0.72 $17.28 no bid no bid $0.65 15.6 no bid no bid

209 Padded Board Splint 3" x 9" EA 24 0.58 13.92 $0.59 $14.16 $0.70 $16.80 no bid no bid $0.85 20.4 no bid no bid

210 Padded Board Splint 3" x 18" EA 24 0.56 13.44 $0.84 $20.16 $1.04 $24.96 no bid no bid $1.19 28.56 no bid no bid

211 Splint Padded Board Kit EA 6 34.6 207.6 $5.82 $34.92 $28.81 $172.86 $30.20 181.2 $37.85 227.1 no bid no bid

SUB TOTAL WOUND CARE 

GROUP 4 $3,280.03 $2,502.84 $2,608.93 $3,304.74 $3,178.48 $0.00

INFECTION CONTROL PRODUCTS GROUP 5

212 Kendall Sharps Shuttle EA 120 1.71 205.2 $1.43 $171.60 $1.64 $196.80 $1.56 187.2 $1.59 190.908 $1.56 $187.20

213 B-D 8 Quart Sharps Container EA 12 6.6 79.2 $5.09 $61.08 $6.08 $72.96 $4.97 59.64 $7.30 87.546 $6.28 $75.36

214 B-D Sharps Coll 6.9qt Rd 305489 EA 24 6.23 149.52 $5.32 $127.68 $6.08 $145.92 $5.69 136.56 $7.30 175.092 $5.93 $142.32

215 Moldex N95 Part Resp w/Nose Flnge Sml Box 6 15.53 93.18 $15.79 $94.74 $19.18 $115.08 $14.47 86.82 $21.34 128.0454 no bid no bid

216 Moldex N95 Part Resp w/Nose Flnge Med Box 6 15.53 93.18 $15.72 $94.32 $19.18 $115.08 $14.47 86.82 $19.92 119.523 no bid no bid

217 Moldex N95 Part Resp w/Nose Flnge Lrg Box 6 15.53 93.18 $15.71 $94.26 $19.18 $115.08 $14.47 86.82 $19.59 117.5454 no bid no bid

218 Super Sani Towlettes, Tub/160 EA 12 5.53 66.36 $0.03 $0.36 $5.68 $68.16 $5.27 63.24 $5.84 70.08 $5.34 $64.08

219 Metrex CaviWipes XL Towelettes ORM EA 72 8.23 592.56 $0.10 $7.20 $5.53 $398.16 $6.79 488.88 $8.02 577.6344 no bid no bid

220 Cidex Gallon EA 24 30.02 720.48 $42.27 $1,014.48 $27.36 $656.64 $22.81 547.44 $18.87 452.88 $16.32 $391.68

221 Cavicide     EA 6 19.87 119.22 $5.85 $35.10 $20.35 $122.10 $15.91 95.46 $21.00 126 $17.52 $105.12

222

Cavicide disinfectant with sprayer 24 oz 12/cs 13-

1024 EA 12 7.76 93.12 $5.85 $70.20 $7.04 $84.48 $73.32 879.84 $6.91 82.9092 $6.11 $73.32

223 Hydrogen Peroxide 3% EA 12 0.92 11.04 $0.53 $6.36 $0.62 $7.44 $0.43 5.16 $0.94 11.28 $0.44 $5.28

224 Hand Gel 4 oz. EA 6 1.08 6.48 $0.98 $5.88 $0.65 $3.90 $0.93 5.58 $1.34 8.04 $0.69 $4.14

225 Alcare Plus ORM  EA 24 9.36 224.64 $7.40 $177.60 $7.69 $184.56 no bid no bid $8.72 209.1816 no bid no bid
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226 Dynarex Povidone Iodine Prep Pads Gen Box 6 3.4 20.4 $2.83 $16.98 $3.27 $19.62 $3.10 18.6 $3.27 19.6362 $3.39 $20.34

227 PDI Benzoin Tincture Swab Sticks Box 12 9.4 112.8 $7.84 $94.08 $9.16 $109.92 $8.57 102.84 $10.67 128.046 $9.09 $109.08

228 Infection Control Kit Deluxe EA 6 4.19 25.14 $3.43 $20.58 $7.65 $45.90 $3.08 18.48 $5.63 33.7896 no bid no bid

229 Biohazard Labels 1" x 3" EA 6 0.0796 0.4776 $0.02 $0.12 $0.02 $0.13 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

230 Hartwell Biohoop Bag W/Hook BH1100H EA 120 17.16 2059.2 $1.37 $164.40 $1.53 $183.60 no bid no bid $1.37 164.316 $1.34 $160.80

231

Microflex Gloves later free Nitrile Powder free 

textured high risk small 50/BX 10BX/CS supreno 

ec Case 6 75.4 452.4 $71.80 $430.80 $75.78 $454.68 $70.00 420 $84.65 507.9 no bid no bid

232

Microflex Gloves latex free Nitrile Powder free 

textured high risk medium 50/BX 10BX/CS 

supreno ec Case 6 75.4 452.4 $71.80 $430.80 $75.78 $454.68 $70.00 420 $84.65 507.9 no bid no bid

233

Microflex Gloves latex free nitrile powder free 

textured high risk large 50/bx 10bx/cs supreno ec Case 60 75.4 4524 $71.80 $4,308.00 $75.78 $4,546.80 $70.00 4200 $84.65 5079 no bid no bid

234

Microflex Gloves latex free nitrile powder free 

textured high risk extra large 50/bx 10bx/cs 

supreno ec Case 60 75.4 4524 $71.80 $4,308.00 $75.78 $4,546.80 $70.00 4200 $84.65 5079 no bid no bid

235 Crews Checkmate Clr/Clr CK110 EA 72 1.91 137.52 no bid no bid $1.73 $124.56 $0.94 67.68 $1.44 103.68 no bid no bid

236

Safety glasses black frame clear lens with xtreme 

anti-fog coating for 10/bx uvex Skyper x2 EA 12 5.03 60.36 $12.13 $145.56 $7.36 $88.32 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

237

Shoe cover non conductive fluid repellant with 

elastic top one size fits all 200/cs EA 22 0.13 2.86 $0.07 $1.54 $0.07 $1.50 no bid no bid $0.13 2.8908 no bid no bid

238 Cord snap fit universal black 25/bx EA 12 1.42 17.04 $3.64 $43.68 $2.48 $29.76 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

239 Coverall impervious medium 25/cs EA 12 2.95 35.4 $4.05 $48.60 $4.73 $56.76 $86.29 1035.48 no bid no bid no bid no bid

240 Coverall impervious extra large 25/cs EA 12 1.52 18.24 $4.05 $48.60 $4.73 $56.76 $86.29 1035.48 no bid no bid no bid no bid

241 Coverall impervious extra extra large 25/cs EA 12 1.61 19.32 $4.25 $51.00 $5.01 $60.12 $91.47 1097.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid

242 Personal protection kit infection control EA 12 4.69 56.28 $3.43 $41.16 $3.82 $45.84 $2.87 34.44 $5.99 71.88 $6.54 $78.48

243 Braun 1000 ml irrigation saline EA 48 1.12 53.76 $1.08 $51.84 $1.33 $63.84 $1.01 48.48 no bid no bid $1.16 $55.68

244 Braun 500 ml irrigation saline EA 120 0.96 115.2 $0.97 $116.40 $1.33 $159.60 $1.08 129.6 no bid no bid $1.16 $139.20

245 Braun 1000ml sterile water EA 24 1.12 26.88 $1.12 $26.88 $1.27 $30.48 $1.00 24 no bid no bid $1.16 $27.84

246 Braun 500ml sterile water EA 24 0.96 23.04 $0.96 $23.04 $1.33 $31.92 $1.02 24.48 no bid no bid $1.16 $27.84

SUB TOTAL FOR INFECTION 

CONTROL GROUP 5 $15,284.08 $12,332.92 $124.56 $15,606.66 $14,054.70 $1,667.76

AWARDED AMOUNT $12,332.92 $124.56

PATIENT HANDLING PRODUCTS GROUP 6

247 Pedi Immobilization Brd LSP EA 2 200.7 401.4 $175.50 $351.00 $355.08 $710.16 $229.44 458.88 $282.53 565.0682 $260.11 $520.22

248 Pedi Immobilizer Case 720061 EA 2 31.6 63.2 $14.93 $29.86 $38.77 $77.54 $31.19 62.38 $38.95 77.9 no bid no bid

249 Restraint Strap 2Pc 5' Brg EA 24 6.25 150 $9.33 $223.92 $6.65 $159.60 $5.84 140.16 no bid no bid no bid no bid

250 Restraint Strap 2Pc 7' Brg EA 24 6.55 157.2 $11.71 $281.04 $6.65 $159.60 $6.12 146.88 no bid no bid no bid no bid

251

AMBU Extrication collar adjustable 16 settings 

30/cs ace perfit EA 360 4.64 1670.4 $4.91 $1,767.60 $5.55 $1,998.00 $153.00 55080 $5.80 2086.38 $4.93 $1,774.80

252

AMBU Extrication collar adjustable pediatric 30/cs 

ace mini EA 240 4.64 1113.6 $4.91 $1,178.40 $5.55 $1,332.00 $153.00 36720 $6.42 1540.92 $4.83 $1,159.20

253 Ultra Short Board NoPn Blue DS EA 2 46.35 92.7 $46.54 $93.08 $48.65 $97.30 $42.22 84.44 $58.81 117.6136 no bid no bid

254 Hare Traction Splint Adult EA 2 195.12 390.24 $224.87 $449.74 $123.88 $247.76 $184.83 369.66 $201.16 402.3182 $134.48 $268.96

255 Hare Traction Splint Pedi EA 2 195.12 390.24 $242.70 $485.40 $123.88 $247.76 $184.83 369.66 $184.08 368.159 $134.48 $268.96

256 Kendrick KODE 2 Extrication EA 2 59.16 118.32 $60.54 $121.08 $160.55 $321.10 $133.30 266.6 $81.50 163 $137.78 $275.56

257 KODE Repl Head/Chin Strap EA 2 7.32 14.64 $3.34 $6.68 $11.64 $23.28 $8.01 16.02 $7.25 14.5 no bid no bid

258 CPR Board #1178 EA 2 66.44 132.88 $47.56 $95.12 $64.85 $129.70 $61.19 122.38 $73.58 147.159 $60.06 $120.12

259 Head immobilizer complete bound tree set EA 24 46.96 1127.04 no bid no bid $76.88 $1,845.12 no bid no bid $57.25 1374 no bid no bid

260

Head immobilizer head support pad 1 ea for bound 

tree head immobilizer 2/cs EA 200 33.54 6708 no bid no bid $30.66 $6,132.00 no bid no bid $16.25 3250 no bid no bid

261 Backboard folding with pins yellow ultra spacsav EA 1 258.54 258.54 $259.97 $259.97 $268.19 $268.19 $235.56 235.56 $274.55 274.5455 $258.54 $258.54

262 Ultra short board yellow no pins EA 1 46.35 46.35 $57.95 $57.95 $48.65 $48.65 $42.22 42.22 $58.81 58.8068 $47.50 $47.50

263

Restraint strap metal push button buckle swivel 

quick clip maroon 2 piece 5 ft EA 24 8.97 215.28 $6.61 $158.64 $8.64 $207.36 no bid no bid $9.44 226.56 no bid no bid

264 Hartwell Fasplint 3 piece kit with compact pump EA 2 939.64 1879.28 $195.97 $391.94 $223.12 $446.24 $118.83 237.66 $202.84 405.6818 no bid no bid

265 Hartwell Fasplint small splint EA 24 15.49 371.76 $6.24 $149.76 $16.58 $397.92 $14.53 348.72 $17.57 421.6368 $16.09 $386.16

266 Hartwell Fasplint medium splint EA 24 18.76 450.24 $17.61 $422.64 $20.08 $481.92 $17.60 422.4 $14.28 342.8184 $19.51 $468.24

267 Hartwell Fasplint large splint EA 24 27.75 666 $27.94 $670.56 $29.70 $712.80 $26.03 624.72 $22.24 533.7264 $28.86 $692.64

268 Hartwell Fasplint carry case EA 2 58.6 117.2 no bid no bid $39.37 $78.74 no bid no bid $27.84 55.6818 $33.58 $67.16

269 Stryker StairPro #6252 DS EA 0 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00

270 Stryker StairPro ABS Seat DS EA 0 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00

271 Stryker StairPro Lckng Hndl DS EA 0 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00

272 StairPro Strap Set Polypro DS EA 0 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00

273

Stryker stair chair polypropylene restraint set 

(plastic buckles) EA 1 55.2 55.2 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00

274 Stryker stair chair polypropylene restraint set EA 1 55.2 55.2 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

275 Moisture Proof Pillow EA 24 5.58 133.92 $4.52 $108.48 $8.78 $210.72 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

276 Stryker power pro cot 6500 EA 1 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $13,328.75 $13,328.75

277 Stryker head end storage flat EA 1 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $117.65 $117.65

278 Stryker pocketed back rest pouch EA 1 0 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00 0 no bid no bid $219.84 $219.84

279 Stryker fowler O2 bottle holder EA 1 231.06 231.06 no bid no bid no bid no bid $210.00 210 no bid no bid $234.24 $234.24

280 Stryker equipment hook EA 1 46.21 46.21 no bid no bid no bid no bid $42.22 42.22 no bid no bid $43.53 $43.53

281 Stryker base storage net (6500) EA 1 177.73 177.73 no bid no bid no bid no bid $155.56 155.56 no bid no bid $170.73 $170.73

282 Stryker 3 stage iv pole (patient right) EA 1 304.23 304.23 no bid no bid no bid no bid $277.78 277.78 no bid no bid $294.12 $294.12

SUB TOTAL FOR PATIENT 

HANDLING GROUP 6 $17,538.06 $7,302.86 $16,333.46 $96,433.90 $12,426.48 $20,716.92

AWARDED TOTAL $15,257.38 $391.94

MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS GROUP 7

283 Scissors 7 1/4 Blk All Purpose" EA 60 1.1 66 $1.41 $84.60 $0.82 $49.20 no bid no bid $0.92 55.2 no bid no bid

284 Cold Packs 6" x 9" Box 24 10.56 253.44 $6.12 $146.88 $12.00 $288.00 no bid no bid $9.95 238.8 no bid no bid

285 Hot Packs 6" x 8" Box 24 7.09 170.16 $6.27 $150.48 $15.34 $368.16 no bid no bid $12.95 310.8 no bid no bid

286 METTAG Triage Tags, pack/50 EA 12 39.98 479.76 $0.67 $8.04 $0.86 $10.32 $33.11 397.32 $0.78 9.4092 no bid no bid

287

Glove dispenser baked enamel white model 12/cs 

glove butler EA 2 19.52 39.04 $18.20 $36.40 $22.11 $44.22 no bid no bid $22.35 44.7 no bid no bid

288 Triad Nail Polish Remover, box/100 Box 6 3.21 19.26 $2.46 $14.76 $3.13 $18.78 no bid no bid $3.00 18 no bid no bid

289 Accessory pouch orange small EA 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

290 Accessory pouch blue large EA 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
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291 Accessory pouch yellow large EA 0 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

292 PDI Lubricating Jelly Pack 2.7 grams Box 12 7.36 88.32 $6.38 $76.56 $7.35 $88.20 no bid no bid $5.40 64.7724 no bid no bid

293 Trauma Shears EA 24 1.79 42.96 $0.82 $19.68 $2.29 $54.96 no bid no bid $0.92 22.08 no bid no bid

294 Ammonia Inhalants Box 12 2.58 30.96 $1.42 $17.04 $1.97 $23.64 no bid no bid $1.91 22.9092 no bid no bid

295 Cot Sheets EA 24 6.15 147.6 no bid no bid $6.85 $164.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

296 Cot Pillows EA 24 2.49 59.76 $4.52 $108.48 $8.78 $210.72 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

297 Cot Blankets EA 24 4.65 111.6 no bid no bid $17.80 $427.20 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

298 Plano Paramedic Trauma Kit 747M #2 EA 2 157.15 314.3 $106.51 $213.02 $172.86 $345.72 no bid no bid $127.24 254.4772 no bid no bid

299 Clipboard Tuff Writer EA 2 20.25 40.5 $19.73 $39.46 $35.93 $71.86 no bid no bid $25.03 50.0682 no bid no bid

300 Breathsaver Plus Grn EA 1 180.49 180.49 $169.49 $169.49 $182.82 $182.82 $164.44 164.44 $168.18 168.18 no bid no bid

301 Ultra Meds Pack Ryl EA 0 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

302 Fanny Pack Nvy EA 2 42 84 $47.74 $95.48 $34.25 $68.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

303 First Aid Bx Empty 10Unt Pls EA 1 1.49 1.49 $3.99 $3.99 $2.09 $2.09 $2.34 2.34 no bid no bid no bid no bid

304 First Aid Bx Empty 24Unt Pls EA 1 6.73 6.73 $13.82 $13.82 $4.12 $4.12 $6.23 6.23 no bid no bid no bid no bid

305 EMS Field Guide EA 6 17.41 104.46 $19.08 $114.48 $21.10 $126.60 $15.85 95.1 $17.95 107.727 no bid no bid

306 Rapid Rescue Spanish EA 2 19.58 39.16 $22.59 $45.18 $26.95 $53.90 $17.97 35.94 no bid no bid no bid no bid

307 Ring Cutter EA 24 10.54 252.96 $5.25 $126.00 $12.75 $306.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

308 Sunx SPF30 Ltn Pouch 71430 pkg/25 12 no bid no bid $54.64 $655.68 $11.11 $133.32 $7.51 90.12 no bid no bid no bid no bid

309 Battery for laerdal suction unit EA 6 57.32 343.92 $73.84 $443.04 $80.20 $481.20 $75.00 450 $88.20 529.227 no bid no bid

310 Ammonia Inhalants ORM Box 12 14.77 177.24 $13.70 $164.40 $1.97 $23.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

311 Glove pouch 3 x 4 inch EA 24 2.26 54.24 $1.93 $46.32 $3.32 $79.68 $3.29 78.96 $2.02 48.5448 no bid no bid

312 Emergency OB Kit/Box #389   EA 12 5.85 70.2 $4.47 $53.64 $6.20 $74.40 $5.65 67.8 no bid no bid no bid no bid

313 Bulb Syringe EA 24 0.23 5.52 $0.37 $8.88 $0.74 $17.76 $0.81 19.44 $0.89 21.36 no bid no bid

SUB TOTAL 

MISCELLANEOUS GROUP 7 $2,931.11 $2,855.80 $3,719.41 $1,407.69 $1,966.26 no bid no bid

AWARDED AMOUNT $2,931.11 $126.00

314 MEDICATION PRODUCTS GROUP 8

315 Tylenol Ex Str Cplts 50x2
EA

4 7.07 28.28 $0.04 $0.16 $0.25 $1.00 $9.20 36.8 no bid no bid no bid no bid

316 Acetaminophen 500mg Tabs 250x2
EA

5 no bid NO BID $0.18 $0.90 $0.07 $0.34 $10.11 50.55 no bid no bid no bid no bid

317 Pseudoval 30mg Tabs 250x2
EA

3 0.8 2.4 no bid no bid no bid NO BID no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

318 Ibuprofen 200mg Tabs 200x2
EA

3 17.25 51.75 $0.06 $0.18 $0.08 $0.23 $9.13 27.39 no bid no bid no bid no bid

319 Bismuth 262mg Tabs 100x2
EA

3 32.44 97.32 $0.13 $0.39 $0.15 $0.45 $6.35 19.05 no bid no bid no bid no bid

320 Aspirin 325mg Tabs 100x2
EA

3 4.8 14.4 $0.13 $0.39 $0.06 $0.17 $3.22 9.66 no bid no bid no bid no bid

321 Medi-First Aspirin Tr-Buf 50x2
EA

4 3.75 15 $0.03 $0.12 $0.07 $0.26 $2.02 8.08 no bid no bid no bid no bid

322 Medi-First Ibuprofn 200mg 50x2
EA

4 4 16 $0.04 $0.16 $0.08 $0.32 $2.91 11.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid

323 Phenylephrine 5mg Tabs 250x2  
EA

4 7.02 28.08 $0.05 $0.20 $0.07 $0.30 $9.41 37.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid

324 Engerix-B 20mcg/1ml SDV SOI-H
EA

40 63.11 2524.4 $59.99 $2,399.60 $71.21 $2,848.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

325 Magnesium Sulfate 5gm 10ml ansyr 10/pk 1027c
EA

65 4.38 284.7 $3.19 $207.35 $11.38 $739.70 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

326 Dopamine 400mg/d5w 250ml 3024 12/cs
EA

50 11.22 561 $6.82 $341.00 $12.01 $600.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

327 Nitro spray 200 metered dose 2092
EA

45 205 9225 $298.83 $13,447.35 $380.07 $17,103.15 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

328 Zofran  4mg  2 ml vial - Ondanasetron EA 250 0.6 150 $0.95 $237.50 $0.73 $182.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

329

Diphenhydramine  50mg/ml 1ml sdv 2035 - 

Benadryl
EA

90 1.03 92.7 $0.84 $75.60 $1.30 $117.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

330

Diphenhydramine  50mg/ml 1ml sdv 2035 - 

Benadryl
EA

91 2.03 184.73 $1.84 $167.44 $2.30 $209.30 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

331 Epinephrine 1:1000 1ml ampule 2043
EA

130 1.18 153.4 $1.35 $175.50 $1.76 $228.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

332 Captopril 25mg tabs 100 ud
EA

200 11.08 2216 no bid no bid $0.02 $3.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

333 MISNUMBERED 0 $0.00

334

Sodium Chloride 0.9% 10ml ansyr flush syringe 

100/bx 2151c

EA

300 0.38 114 $0.33 $99.00 $0.45 $136.08 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

335 Adenosine 6mg  2ml sdv 2001
EA

135 5.5 742.5 $6.44 $869.40 $16.57 $2,236.95 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

336 Albuterol 0.083%  2.5mg  3ml vial 25/bx 2006
EA

300 3.5 1050 $0.18 $54.00 $0.19 $55.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

337 C2 morphine 10mg 1ml sdv 25/bx cs25
EA

300 31.5 9450 $0.67 $201.00 $1.60 $480.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

338 Calcium Chloride usp 10 % 1g per 10 ml
EA

65 2.89 187.85 $1.91 $124.15 $4.07 $264.49 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

339 Atropine 1mg, 10ml luer jet 1006b
EA

180 2.45 441 $3.03 $545.40 $4.07 $732.42 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

340 Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% 50ml luer jet 1035b
EA

90 2.95 265.5 $2.81 $252.90 $6.44 $579.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

341

C4  Midazolam (versed) 5mg/ml 1ml vial 10/box 

cs11

EA

150 10.86 1629 $1.71 $256.50 $2.27 $340.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

342 Glucagen 1mg 2050
EA

70 109 7630 $102.27 $7,158.90 $136.28 $9,539.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

343 Etomidate 40mg 20ml vial 2145
EA

150 9.02 1353 $11.88 $1,782.00 $9.94 $1,491.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

344 Dextrose 50% 25gm 50ml luer jet 1013b
EA

150 3.65 547.5 $2.73 $409.50 $6.44 $966.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

345 Epinephrine 1:10,000 luer jet 1019b
EA

300 2.15 645 $2.37 $711.00 $4.07 $1,220.70 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

346 Naloxone 2mg, 2ml luer jet 1029b
EA

130 14.5 1885 $15.71 $2,042.30 $18.87 $2,452.84 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

347 Amiodarone 150mg, 3ml luer jet 2149c
EA

175 1.71 299.25 no bid no bid $10.24 $1,792.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

348 Lidocaine 2% 100mg, 5ml luer jet 1026b
EA

100 2.45 245 $1.97 $197.00 $4.07 $406.90 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

349 Aspirin children's chewable 81mg 36/bt 2019
EA

80 0.79 63.2 $0.02 $1.60 $0.02 $1.75 no bid no bid $0.99 79.2 no bid no bid

350 Enalaprilat 1.25 mg/ml vial
EA

75 2.69 201.75 $1.76 $132.00 $9.08 $681.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

351 C2  Fentanyl 0.05mg/ml 2ml sdv  25/bx
EA

600 22.87 13722 $0.77 $462.00 $0.22 $134.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

352 Insta-Glucose 31gm 2064  12/cs EA 150 3.27 490.5 $2.77 $415.50 $5.05 $757.50 no bid no bid $3.99 598.5 no bid no bid

353 Ipratropium Bromide 0.02%, 2.5ml, 30/bx
EA

250 4.72 1180 $0.17 $42.50 $0.20 $49.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

SUB TOTAL FOR 

MEDICATION GROUP 8 $57,787.21 $32,810.49 $46,354.28 $200.81 $677.70 no bid no bid

AWARDED AMOUNT $9,526.65 $32,348.33 $138.38

% DISCOUNT FOR ALL ITEMS NOT 

LISTED ON THE BID FORM 18.00% 15.00% 12.00%

% REFUND ON EXPIRED, RETURNED DRUGS 100.00% 7.00% 0.00%

GRAND TOTAL AWARDED $58,916.56 $45,073.19 $20,345.51 $10,981.47


