
CITY OF FRISCO, TEXAS 
	

ORDINANCE NO. 13-10-68 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FRISCO, TEXAS, REPEALING 
ORDINANCE NO. 08-04-40; AMENDING DIVISION 6 (BUILDING 
CODE), ARTICLE IV (TECHNICAL CODES), CHAPTER 18 
(BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS), PART II OF THE 
FRISCO CODE OF ORDINANCES; ADOPTING THE 2012 EDITION OF 
THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX K, 
SAVE AND EXCEPT THE DELETIONS AND ADDITIONS SET FORTH 
HEREIN; REGULATING THE CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, 
MOVEMENT, ENLARGEMENT, REPLACEMENT, REPAIR, 
EQUIPMENT, USE AND OCCUPANCY, LOCATION, REMOVAL, AND 
DEMOLITION OF EVERY BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR ANY 
APPURTENANCES CONNECTED OR ATTACHED TO SUCH 
BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES WITHIN THE CITY OF FRISCO, 
TEXAS; PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY FOR THE VIOLATION OF 
THIS ORDINANCE; PROVIDING FOR REPEALING, SAVINGS AND 
SEVERABILITY CLAUSES; PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE 
OF THIS ORDINANCE; AND PROVIDING FOR THE PUBLICATION OF 
THE CAPTION HEREOF. 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Frisco, Texas ("City Council") has 
investigated and determined that it would be advantageous, beneficial and in the best interest to 
the citizens of the City of Frisco, Texas ("Frisco") to amend Division 6 (Building Code), Article 
IV (Technical Codes), Chapter 18 (Buildings and Building Regulations), Part II of the Frisco's 
Code of Ordinances by adopting the 2012 Edition of the International Building Code, including 
Appendix K, save and except the deletions and additions set forth below; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council has investigated and determined that in order to most 
effectively make the deletions and additions necessary to Division 6 (Building Code), Article IV 
(Technical Codes), Chapter 18 (Buildings and Building Regulations), Part If of the Frisco's Code 
of Ordinances, it is in the best interest of the citizens of Frisco to repeal, in its entirety, 
Ordinance No. 08-04-40 (Building Code) and replace it with this Ordinance, adopting the 2012 
Edition of the International Building Code, including Appendix K, save and except the deletions 
and additions set forth below. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF FRISCO, TEXAS: 

SECTION 1: Findings Incorporated. The findings set forth above are incorporated into 
the body of this Ordinance as if fully set forth herein. 

SECTION 2: Repeal of Ordinance No. 08-04-40. Ordinance No. 08-04-40 is hereby 
repealed, in its entirety, and replaced by this Ordinance. The effective date of the repeal 
discussed in this Section shall not occur until the effective date of this Ordinance at which time 
Ordinance No. 08-04-40 shall be repealed. Such repeal shall not abate any pending prosecution 
and/or lawsuit or prevent any prosecution and/or lawsuit from being commenced for any 
violation of Ordinance No. 08-04-40 occurring before the effective date of this Ordinance 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (201 2 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 1 0F 36 
67447.2 







Exhibit "A" 
CITY OF FRISCO DELETIONS/ADDITIONS 
2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE' 

The following deletions and additions to the 2012 International Building Code are hereby 
approved and adopted (i.e. deletions evidenced by stfikethr-ough and additions evidenced by 
underline)2 :  

Chapter I. Scope and Administration of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

Section 102 Applicability of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in 
this code shall be considered as part of the requirements of this code to the 
prescribed extent of each such reference and as further regulated in Sections 
102.4.1 and 102.4.2. Whenever amendments have been adopted by Frisco as 
they exist or may be further amended, to the referenced codes and standards, each 
reference  to said codes and standards shall be considered to reference the 
amendments and any future amendments thereto. 

Section 105 Permits of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

105.2 Work exempt from permit. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Building: 

1. One story detached accessory structures tc.:ed ati-teal-ai=k4-storage-sheds 
Provided the floor 	es-not exceed 120 — 

square feet (11 m2) 

2. Fence not over 7 feet (2134 mm) high. 

6. Sidewalks and dFi.' icways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above 
adjeeent-grade, and no 
of an accessible route. 

Section 108 Temporary Structures and Uses of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

108.1 General. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary 
structures and temporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, 

Unless otherwise expressly provided herein, all phrases, words and/or terms used herein shall have the same 
meaning ascribed to the same in the 2012 International Building Code (regardless of whether such phrases, words 
and/or terms are italicized herein), 

z  Other italicized and bold notations are provided throughout for informational purposes only. By way of example 
only, "fParagraph remains ufteitanged.1". 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
627447 2 

PAGE 4 OF 36 



but shall not be permitted for more than 180 days. The building official is 
authorized to grant extensions for demonstrated cause. Such permits shall be 
issued upon compliance with the reiluirements of Section 3103 as adopted and 
amended and  other Ordinances applicable to tem_porary structures or temporary 
uses. 

Section 109 Fees of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

109.2 Sehedtile—of—pertnit—feesPermit,  Inspection and Miscellaneous 
Consolidated Fee Schedule.  e 	 . 	. . -, - 	-., 	- 	-anic 
and-pl 	 'ng a permit, a fee-for-eaeh-pefati4-shall 
be paid as required,  in ace 
applicable governing authorityThe  following Permit. Inspection and. 
Miscellaneous Consolidated Fee Schedule shall apply to the construction, 
alteration, movement, enlarixment, replacement repair, equipment. use and 
occupancy, location_ removal, and demolition  of  every building or structure  and 
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures within Frisco:  

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.' 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 5 OF 36 
6274472 



Permit, Inspection and Miscellaneous Consolidated Fee Schedule 
Building Permit Fees 

 

Commercial Building Pe rrnit 	1%60 of Table Value 

Residential Building Permit 

Table 1 A 

Table 1-A 

TABLE 1-A* 

 
 

Si to $500.00 

$500 .01 to $2,000.00 

$2,000.01 to $25,000.00 

$25,000.01 to $50,000.00 

$50,000.01 to $100,000.00 

$100,000.01 to $500,000.00 

$500,000.01 to $1,000,000.00 

$1,000,000.01 and above 

$23.51) 

$23.513 tor the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional $100, or fraction thereof, to and in eluding $2,000. 

$625 for the first $2,000 plus 514,00 breach additional$1, MUM, or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000, 

$3til.25 for the first $25.000 plus $10.10 for each additional $1,000 , orfraction thereof, to end inc luding $50,000. 

$643.75 feirthe first $50,000 plus $7.00 for each add itional $1,01X, of - fraction thereof, to and Including $100,000 

$943.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.00 for aach additional $1,000, or frac lion thereof, to and includirig $500,000., 

$3233.75 for t he first $500,000 plus $4,75 for each 2cist It tonal $1,000, or frac Von thereof, to and including $1,000,000. 

$5,606.75 for the first $1,000,0010 pies $3.16 for eaoh additional st Goa or frac tion thereof, 

Inspection  outside of normal  business hours $150.00 

    

* Commercial building permit fees are assessed on the basis of 5660 - of the calculated value of Table 1-A 

Miscellaneous 

Certificate of Occupancy (Change of business name, ownership or use) 

Certificate of Occupancy (Non-Conforming Use) 

Demolition Permit 

Reroof Permit 

Detached Accessory Building (<100 sq ft) 

Detached Accessory Building (.1.00 sq ft, <1E0 sq ft) 

Detached Accessory Building (a16Cisq ft) 

Duplicate Permit Placard and Reports  

Commercial Irrigation - Per meter  

Single Meter 

Second Meter add + 

Three and Greater Meters  

Residential Irrigation Permit 

Reinspection Fee (Residential) 

Reinspection Fee (Commercial) 

Spa Permit 

Structure Move Permit 

Swimming Pool (Above Ground) 

Swimming Pool (Below Ground) 

Swimming Pool (Befow Grounci w/ spa) 

Temporary Building Permit  	 

$100.00 
$25.00 

Ssa OD 

$150.00 

525.00 

$50.00 

Table 1 A 

$10.00 

$250.00 

$175.00 

$500.00  

$185.00 

$30.00 

$3500 

$76.00 

$51/00 

$100.00 

$200.00 

$275.00 

$50.00 

Electrical Permit Fees 

For issuance of each  permit 

For issuance of each  supplemental permit 

All inclusive Residential permit by permit Square Footage 

All inclusive Commercial permit by permit Square Footage 

Electrical Meter Release 

iath Residential Appliance 

Ejtch Commercial Appliance 

Each Temporary Services 

Each rvitsc Apparatus 

Motors (Horse power) ea. 

Up to 1 

1, not over 10 

10, not over 50 

50, not over 100 

over 100 

Service Installation Replacement (Amps) ea. 

Up to 200 
200, up to 1000 

Over 1000 amps 

$30.00 

$10.00 

$0.03! per sqft 

$0.04! per sqft 

$45.00 

$4.75 

$4.75 

$23.50 

$18.20 

$4.75 

$12.30 

$24.60 

$49.50 

$74.50 

$65.00 

$85.00 

$150.00 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 12012 EDIT1ONI 
627447 2 

PACE 6 OF 36 



rai-eitianical Permit Fees 

For issuance of each permit $30.00 

$0.05/gsf 

$10.00 
For New finish-out/alterations 

For issuance of each supplemental permit 

Furnaces 

Installation or relocation of each  forced air unit up to and including 100,000131:L4h 

Installation or relocation of each forced air unit over 100,000 Btu/h 

Installation or relocation of each floor furnace 

$13.25 

$16.25 

$13.25 

$13_25 installation or relocation of eh suspended heater, recessed wall heater orfioor-n 

Appliance Vents 

Installation, relocation or replacement of each vent $7. 00 

Repairs or Additions 

Repair of, Alteration of or Addition of e_w& heating or cooling appliance $12.25 

Boiler, Compressor and Absorption Systems 

lestallation or relocation of each boiler or compressor to including 3 horsepower 

$13.25 

$24.25 

$33.25 

$49.50 

$82.75 

or up to and including 100,000 Flau/h 

lestoilation or relocation of each boiler or compressor to including 3- 15 

horsepower or over 100,000- 500,000 EItu/h 

I nstallation or relocation of each  boiler or compressor to including 15- 30 

horsepower or over 500,000- 1,000,000 Btu/h 

Installation or relocation of each  boiler or compressor to including 30- 50 

horsepower or over 1,000,000- 1,750,000 Mufti 

Installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor to over 50 horsepower or 

over 1,750,000 Btu" 

Air Handlers 

Installation or relocation of each  air-handling to and including 10,000 cubic feet 

Note; nits does not apply to an air handling unit Which Is a part of a factory assembled appilance 

Installation or relocation of each air handling over 10,000 cubic feet 

$9.50 

$16.50 

Evaporative Coolers 

Installation or relocation of gath evaporative cooler other than portable type $9.50 

Ventilation and Exhaust 

Installation or relocation of each ventilation van fan connected to d singie duct or h $6.50 

Miscellaneous - Installation or relocation of each fuel gas pi ping systems 

One to Four outlets 

Each additional outlet exceeding four 

$5. 00 

$1.00 

Plumbing Permit Pees 

For issuance of each  permit 

For New finish-out/alterations 

$30.00 

$0.09/gsf 

For issuance of each supplemental permit $10.00 

Forger& plumbing fixture on one trap or a set of fixtures on one trap (including 

water, drainage piping and backflow protection therefore) $7.00 

For each building sewer and each trailer park sewer $15.00 

Rainwater systems - per drain (inside building) $1.00 

For each cesspool (where permitted) $25.00 

For each private sewage disposal system $ $40 op 

For each water heater and / or vent $ $7.00 

For each gas-piping of one to five outlets $5.00 

For each additional gas piping system outlet, per outlet $1.00 

For each  industrial waste pretreatment interceptor including its trap and vent, 

except kitchen type grease interceptors functioning as fixture traps $7.00 

For each installation, alteration or repair of water piping and / or water treating ece $7.00 

For each repair or alteration of drainage or vent piping, each fixture $7.00 

For each lawn sprinkler system on any one meter including backfiow protection des $35.00 

For atitiosgteric-type vacuum breakers 

I to 5 

over 5 each  

$5.00 

For each backfiow protective device other than atmospheric type vacuum breakers 

2 inch (51mm) diameter and smaller $7.00 

over 2 inch (51mm) $15.00 

For each  graywate r system $40.00 

For initial installation and testing for a reclaimed water system $30.00 

For each annual cross-connection testing of a reclaimed water system (excluding in $30.00 

For each medical gas piping system serving one to five Inlet(s) / outlet(s) for a spec $50.00 

Forger& additional medical gas inlet(s) / outiet(s) $5.00 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 Em ItION) 
	

PAGE 7 OF 36 
627447,2 



109.2.2 Plan review fees. Plan review fees shall be required when, in the 
judgment of the building official, submitted documents require special  
review by a third party  Plan Review Service. The plan review fee shall be 
sixty-five percent (65%) of the building permit fee.  

Additional plan review 	change 	or revisigns to 
approved plans will be assessed a plan review fee at the rate of fifty 
&1,ksa$5_0,00)  per hour with a minimum charge of one (1) hour.  

109.6 Refunds. The building official 	 refund policy. 
may authorize the refundinft of any_fee  paid hereunder which was erroneously  
paid or collected.  

The building official may authorize refunding not more that eighty percent  (80%) 
of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under  a_germit issued in 
accordance with this code.  

The building official may authorize the refunding of not more than eighty percent 
(80%) of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which plan 
review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan reviewing is 
done. 

The building official may not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon  
written request filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date 
of the fee payment.  

Section 110 Inspections of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

110.3.5 Lath and gypsum board inspection. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged] 

Exception: [Entire exception deleted.] 

Chapter 2. Definitions of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 202 Definitions of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

High-Rise Building.  A building with an occupied floor located more than 7-5 55 
feet (22 860  16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 

Chapter 3. Use and Occupancy Classification of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

Section 304 Business Group B of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

304.1 Business Group B. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Fire stations 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE S OF 36 
627447.2 



Police  stations with detention facilities for 5 or less 

Section 311 Storage Group S of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

311.2 Moderate-hazard storage, Group S-1. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Self-service storage facility  

Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy of the 2012 
International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 403 High-Rise Buildings of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

403.1 Applicability. [Paragraph remains unchanged.' 

Exception: The provisions of Sections 403.2 through 403.6 shall not 
apply to the following buildings and structures: 

3. Open air portions of buildings with a Group A-5 occupancy in 
accordance with Section 303.6. 

403.3 Automatic sprinkler system. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required in spaces 
or areas of: 

exclusively for 
te[seefaintinications equipment, associated elect.Fical power 
distribution equipment, better-4es and standby engines -provided 

	

Else 	Elf 

automatic fire detection system in Luxor-di:men with Section 907.2  
g-by-not-lesti 

than 1 hour fire harriers constructed in accordance with Section 
707 or  :  ction-in 

4033.4 Smokeproof enclosures. Every required exit stairway serving 
floors more than 75 55 feet (22 860  16 764 mm) above the lowest level of 
fire department vehicle access shall be a sniokeproof enclosure in 
accordance with Sections 909.20 and 1022.10. 

Section 406 Motor-Vehicle-Related Occupancies of the 2012 International Building 
Code is amended as follows: 

406.3.4 Separation. Separations shall comply with the following: 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITioN) 
	

PAGE 9 OF 36 
Er274472 



1. The private garage shall be separated from the dwelling unit and its attic 
area by means of gypsum board, not less than 1r2-5/8 inch (12.7  15.9 mm) 
in thickness, applied to the garage side. Garages beneath habitable rooms 
shall be separated from all habitable rooms above by not less than a 5/8- 
inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board or equivalent and 1/2  5/8-inch 
(12.7  15.9 nun) gypsum board applied to structures supporting the 
separation from habitable rooms above the garage. Door openings 
between a private garage and the dwelling unit shall be equipped with 
either solid wood doors or solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less 
than 1 3/8 inches (34,9 mm) in thickness, or doors in compliance with 
Section 716.5.3 with a fire protection rating of not less than 20 minutes. 
Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping 
purposes shall not be permitted. Doors shall be tight fitting, self-closing 
and self-latching. 

406.8 Repair garages. Repair garages shall be constructed in accordance with 
the International Fire Code and Sections 406.8.1 through 406.8.6. This 
occupancy shall not include motor fuel-dispensing facilities, as regulated in 
Section 406.7. This occupancy shall include garages involved in servicing of 
motor vehicles for items such as Iube changes. inspections, windshield repair or  
replacement, shocks,minor part replacement and other such non-major repair.  
When the repair garage is only involved in such minor repair and not involved in 
combustible or flammable liuuids, it need not comply with  Section 406.8.1. 

Chapter 5. General Building Heights and Areas of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

Section 501 General of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

501.2 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided with 
approved address numbers or letters. Each character shall not be less than 4 6 
inches (102-152 mm) in height and not less than of 0.5  1 inch (12.7  25A mm) in 
width. They shall be installed on a contrasting background and be plainly visible 
from the street or road fronting the property and from all alleyways, fire lanes, or 
other vehicle access to the rear  or side of the b -uilclings. When required by the fire 
code official, address numbers shall be provided in additional approved locations 
to facilitate emergency response. Where access is by means of a private road and 
the building address cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or 
other approved sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address 
numbers shall be maintained. 

Section 503 General Height and Area Limitations of the 2012 International Building 
Code is amended as follows: 

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANICI 

INTERNATIONAL  BUILDINC CODE (2012 EDMON) 
	

PAGE 100F36 

627447.2 



TABLE 503 
ALLOWABLE BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS' b  

Building height limitations shown in feet above grade plane. Story limitations shown as stories above grade plane. 
Building area 	limitations shown 	M square feet, as  determined by 	the definition of "Area, building," per story 

TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION 

TYPE I 

A  I  B 	A 

HEIGHT% feeti 	Di 	150 	65 

B 	I 	A 

55 	I 	65 

TYPE iv 
HT  

65 

TYPE V  

A  

50 	40 

GROUP 
STORIES(SJ 

AREA (A)  

16,000 

U. 	4 

UL 	24,006 

4 IsTP 	4 NP 

24,000 NE, 	lb 	NP 

4 NP 

20,-500 NP 

X NP 

4-27060 NP  

3 NP 

;WO NP 
R-1 
	 UL 

A 
	

UL 

Section 504 Height of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

504.2 Automatic sprinkler system increase. Where a building is equipped 
throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1 (NFPA 131, the value specified in Table 503 for maximum 
building height is increased by 20 feet (6096 mm) and the maximum number of 
stories is increased by one story. These increases are permitted in addition to the 
building area increase in accordance with Sections 506.2 and 506.3. For Group R 
buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 (NFPA 13R), the value specified in Table 503 
for maximum building height is increased by 20 feet (6096 mm) and the 
maximum number of stories is increased by one story, but shall not exceed 60 feet 
(18 288 mm) or four stories, respectively. Basements and below grade parking 
structures, if provided, shall be considered a story when determining the 
maximum allowable height when the above grade portion is constructed of Type 
V construction. Buildings containing mixed uses in conjunction  with Group R-2  
shall not exceed a total of four stories or 60 feet (18 288 mm) regardless of 
separation by Types of Construction as allowed in Section 508. 

Exception: [Entire exception remains unchanged.] 

Section 506 Building Area Modifications of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

506.2.2 Open space limits. Such open space shall be either on the same 
Jot or dedicated for public use and shall be accessed from a street or 
approved fire lane. In order to be considered accessible, if not in direct 
contact with a street or fire lane, a minimum 10 feet (3048 mm) wide 
paved pathway or other all-weather drivable surface from the street or 
approved fire lane must be provided.  

Section 508 Mixed Use and Occupancy of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

508.1 General. Each portion of a building shall be individually classified in 
accordance with Section 302.1 Where a building contains more than one 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2(12 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 11 0F36 

6274472 



occupancy group, the building or portion thereof shall comply with the applicable 
provisions of Sections 508.2, 508.3 or 508A, or a combination of these sections. 
At a minimum, each tenant space within any multi-tenant building shall  be 
Leparated by a one-hour fire partition  complying  with Section 708 regardless of 
occupancy type.  

Section 510 Special Provisions of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

510.4 Parking beneath Group R. Where a maximum one story above grade 
plane Group S-2 parking garage, enclosed or open, or combination thereof, of 
Type I construction or open of Type IV construction, with grade entrance, is 
provided under a building of Group R, the number of stories to be used in 
determining the minimum type of construction shall be measured from the floor 
above such a parking area. However, Type V wood frame construction shall be  
limited to three stories above the parking structure.  The floor assembly between 
the parking garage and the Group R above shall comply with the type of 
construction required for the parking garage and shall also provide a fire-
resistance rating not less than the mixed occupancy separation required in Section 
508.4. 

Chapter 7. Fire and Smoke Protection Features of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

Section 708 Fire Partitions of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

7083 Fire-resistance rating. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

ons-in-huildings-ef45Te 
11B, 	111B-and-VB-construction shall have fife resistance ratings of  

rougheut-,,vilh-aft 
kM in accordance  with Sectien-903.3.1.1. 

708.4 Continuity. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

e: 

1. The fire partiti 	 -;  in 	a covered mail 
building,  complying with—Section 102.7.2, aFe  Het  Fequired to 

t part of  a fire  

spaces-ab 

5. Attic firebloc 
line in Groun P 

 
 

ition 
bur-steties-above 11 GO flC 

grade plane, provided the attic-spa 	EIDEDViEleEI-D E mg 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION1 
	

PAGE 12 OF 36 

62/447.2 



Chapter 9. Fire Protection Systems of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

Section 903 Automatic Sprinkler Systems of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

903.1.2 Residential Systems. Unless specifically allowed by this code,  
residential sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13D and 
NFPA 13R shall not be recognized for the purposes of exceptions or 
reductions commonl referred to as "trade-offs" Med b  other 
requirements of this code or other codes.  

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings 
and structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 
through 903.2.12. Buildings on the same lot shall adhere to  the combined 
aggregate sum of the total square feet. Separation on the same lot does  not  qualify 
as separate square footage. Automatic sprinklers  shall be installed in elevator 
machine rooms and elevator machine spaces. Automatic sprinklers shall be 
installed in elevator hoistways where combustible materials are present or the 
elevator shaft is constructed of combustible construction. Storage shall not he 
allowed within the elevator machine room. Signage shall be provided at the entry 
doors to the elevator machine room indicating "ELEVATOR MACHINERY —  
NO STORAGE ALLOWED."  

Exception: [Entire exception remains unchanged.] 

903.2.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1 shall be provided throughout buildings and portions 
thereof used as Group A occupancies as provided in this section. For 
Group A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4 occupancies, the automatic sprinkler system 
shall be provided throughout the floor area where the Group A-1, A-2, A-3 
or A-4 occupancy is located and in an floors from the Group A occupancy 
to, and including, the nearest level of exit discharge serving the Group A 
occupancy. For Group A-5 occupancies, the automatic sprinkler system 
shall be provided in the spaces indicated in Section 903.2.1.5. 

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided for Group A-1 occupancies where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m 2) 5,000 
square feet (464.5 in 2) or is greater than two stories in 
height; 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 13 OF 36 

6274472 



903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided for Group A-2 occupancies where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464.5 m 2),  or is 
greater than one stories in height; 

903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided for Group A-3 occupancies where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m) 5,000 
square feet (464.5 m 2 ) or is greater than two stories in 
height; 

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided for Group A-4 occupancies where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet-014-5-m) 5,000, 
square feet (464.5 in2) or is greater than two stories in 
height. 

903.2.2.1 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
Provided for Group B occupancies where on the  following. 
condition exists:  

1. Where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.  

903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout entire buildings containing a for Group E fire area occupancies 
aS4011-033003. 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 12,000 square 
teet-(4-1-1-5-m3) in area. 

2. Throughout every—portion—of-e 

Exception fEntire exception deleted] 

903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system in accordance  with 
Section 903.3.1 shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a 
Group F-1 occupancy where  one of the following conditions exists: the 
fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464.5m 2_1 

1. A Group F 1 fire 	exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 ni 2), 

2. A Group F 1 fire area is located 
	

EleAke 

grade-plane, 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 

	
PAGE 14 0F 36 

627447,2 



3. The combined  
30-m2), 

We. 

I--T--he-c-ombined-area-of--all Group F 1 fire areas -en all floors, 
..ogee 1-;04J0 square feet  (2230 rn2), 

olstered 
foraitare-er--fflattfease-s-exceeds  2,500 square feet--(-2-32-m2), 

903.2.6 Group I. An automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1  shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group I 
fire area. 

Exceptions-1 'Entire exceptions deleted] 

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.11.1  shall be provided throughout buildings containing a 
Group M occupancy where one of-the-foil  4.  .  • - : where  
the  Group M fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). A Group M 
Occupancy used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture must 
have an automatic sprinkler sigem installed regardless of square  footage.  

-1. A Group  NI fire area  exceeds 12,000-squar-e-fee-1-(-14-1-5-m 2): 

2, A Group M fire ar- a  is located more than three stories above 
grade plane. 

1. A  Group M  o 
upholstered  fir1+41-1-Fe or mattresses exceeds  5,000  square feet (161  

903.2.83 Groun R additions. Group R ()ccu =cies JO would 
require an automatic  sprinkler  system due  to additions or 
remodeling must add automatic sprinkler systems to those areas 
that are additions Or alterations of the original building or structure.  

903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3,1.1  shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a 
Group S-1 occupancy, occupancy where one-of-the-following conditions 

ists: 

1, A GFoup  'S 1 fire  are 	oeds 	12.000 sum 

tte 
	 ted--more-than-three 	storief; aboN 

grade plane. 

3. The-c-ambined-area  of all Group  S I life areas on  all floors,  
including any mezzanines, exceeds  24,000 square  feet (2230 m2), 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 15 OF 36 
627447.2 



qbe-stor 
or 	fife area exeeeds 5,-OW square feet 06'1 m 2), 

5. A Group S 1 occupancy used for The sterage ef upholstered 
a-a 	 e feet (232  rn2* 

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout all buildings used as repair garages in 
accordance with Section 406.  as shown: 

grape plane. 
including basements, with a fire area containing ix • 
garage-exceeding-1-0 3000-square-feet-€929-m 2), 

&SAM 100—saiiige 

rquare feet (1115 m2), 

arked 
in basements. 

4. A Group S 1 fire 	area used for the repair of commercial 
truc-k 
feet (46/1 m2): 

903.2.9.1 Self-service storage facilities. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be installed throuclout all buildinRs containiniz a 
Group S-1 self-service storage facility. A screen shall be installed  
at eighteen (1,8) inches below the level of the sprinkler heads to 
restrict storage above that level. The screen shall be a mesh of not  
less than one (1) inch nor greater than six (6) inches in size. The  
screen and its supports shall be installed such that all elements are 
at least eiahteen (18) inches below any sprinkler heads. 

903.2.10 Group S-2 enclosed parking garages. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout buildings classified as enclosed 
parking garages in accordance with Section 406.4 as follows: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed-parking garage exceeds 
12 000 square feet (1115 m2)-5,000 square feet (1115 m 2.); or 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage is located beneath and/or 
attached to other occupancy groups. 

Exceptien [Entire exception deleted.] 

903.2.10.2 Group 5-2 open parking garages. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings classified  

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (20J 2 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 16 OF 36 
627447.2 



as open parking  garages  in accordance with Section 406.3 of this 
code as follows:  

1. Where the open parking garage is located beneath 
and/or attached to other oceupancv groups. 

903.2.11 Specific building areas and hazards. In all occupancies ether 
than Group U, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed for building 
design or hazards in the locations set forth in Sections 903.2.11.1 through 
903.2.11.6. 

903.2.11.3 Buildings 55-35 feet or more in height. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings with a 
floor level having an occupant load of 30 or more that is located 5-5 
(16 761 mm)  35 feet (10 668mm) or more above the lowest level 
of fire department vehicle access. 

Exceptions: [Entire exceptions deleted' 

903.2.11.7 New and Existing buildings. Automatic sprinkler 
systems shall be installed:  

1. In all new buildings with a gross floor area of 5,000 
square feet (1115 m 2 ) or greater and/or greater than two 
stories in height.  

2. In existing buildings when additions are made that 
increase the gross floor area to 5,000 square feet (1115 m-2.) 
or greater and/or greater than  two stories in heipht. 

3. In existing buildings with a gross floor area greater than 
5.000 square feet (1115 m 2 ) when any alteration  is made 
affecting thirty Percent (30%) or more of the building, 

903.2.11.8 Spray Booths and Rooms. New s.praY booths and 
spa ityAg_sooms shall be protected by an approved automatic fire.  
extinguishing system.  

9033.1 Standards. Sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in 
accordance with Sections 903.3.1.1 unless otherwise permitted by 
Sections 903.3.1.2 and 903.3.1.3 and other chapters of this code, as 
applicable. $prinkler systems shall be designed and installed in 
accordance with NFPA 13 and NFPA 13R.  

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations. Automatic sprinklers shall 
may be exempted from not be requited in the following 
rooms Or areas when specifically permitted by the fire code 
official and where such rooms or areas are protected with 
an approved automatic fire detection system in accordance 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 17 Or 36 
6274472 



with Section 9072 that will respond to visible or invisible 
particles of combustion and such rooms meet other 
requirements as determined by the fire code official. 
Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room merely 
because it is damp, of fire-resistance-rated construction or 
contains electrical equipment. 

903.3.1.2. NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler 
systems in Group R occupancies up to and including four stories in 
height shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance 
with NEPA 13R. Unless specifically allowed by this code.  
residential sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 
13R shall not be recognized for the purposes of exceptions or  
reductions commonly referred to as "tradeoffs", permitted by other 
reouirements of this code or the International Fire Code. In 
addition, residential  sprinkler systems installed in accordance with  
NFPA 13R must include attic sprinkler protection to be recognized  
for the purposes of such "tradeoffs" permitted by other sections of 
this code.  

903.3.1.2.1 Balconies and decks. Sprinkler protection shall 
be provided for exterior balconies, decks and ground floor 
patios of dwelling units.  where the huilding-ls-of-Type-AL 
construction, provided there is a reef or deck above :  
Sidewall sprinklers that are used to protect such areas shall 
be permitted to be located such that their deflectors are 
within 1 inch (25mm) to 6 inches (152 mm) below the 
structural members and a maximum distance of 14 inches 
(356 mm) below the deck of the exterior balconies and 
decks that are constructed of open wood joist construction. 

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler 
systems installed in one- and two-family dwellings ;  Group R-3 and 
R-4 congregate residences and townhouses shall be permitted to be 
installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D. Unless 
specifically allowed by this code, residential sprinkler systems 
installed in accordance with NFPA 13D shall not be recognized for 
the purposes of exceptions or reductions  commonly referred to as 
"tradeoffs", permitted by other requirements of this code or the 
International Fire Code.  

903.3.5. Water supplies. Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems 
shall comply with this section and the standards referenced in section 
903.3.1. The potable water supply shall be protected against backflow in 
accordance with the requirements of this section and the International 
Plumbing Code. Water supply as required for such systems shall be 
provided in conformance with the supply requirements of the  respective 
standards:. however, every fire protection system shall be designed with a 
10-psi safety factor.  

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 121)12 EDITION) 
	

PAGE Ig OF 36 
627447 2 



903.3.5.1 Domestic services. [Entire subsection deleted.] 

903.33.1 One and Two-Family dwellina combination services. 
A single combination water supply shall be allowed as required by 
NFPA 13D  and the International Plumbing Code.  

903.3.5.1.1 Limited—afea—sprinider—systentsi [Entire 
subsection deleted.] 

903.3.5.1.2 Residentio4—enmblrtHtion—seFviees-.- [Entire 
subsection deleted' 

903.33.2 Seeondary-Nvater--supply= [Entire subsection deleted.] 

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

-6 
	 g-one and two family 

dwellings, 

2. Limited area systems serving-fewer than 20 sprinklers. 

orutonl stems intalIed-inaceerdaneeth-N-14 24 
13R where a  COMII 

water-and- 

 

EH9 	 tic 
separate shutoff 

em-is-net-prtwitlekl, 

 

1--kitehen-hoodspaint-spfa.fbooths 
of dip tanks that are-sea au-or-ic 	an-goon-De 

Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one and two familY dwellings are required  
to be monitored for a water flow condition for each system. Sprinkler and  
standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the  
sprinkler system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more 
than 45 seconds. All control valves in the snrinkler and standpipe systems except 
for the fire department hose connection valves shall be electrically supervised to  
initiate a supervisory signal at the central station upon tampering. 

903.4.2 Alarms. Approved audible devices, located on the exterior of the 
building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automatic 
sprinkler system. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be 
activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the 
smallest orifice size installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be  
provided on the exterior of the building in an approved location. Where a 
fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system 
shall actuate the building fire alarm system. At least one approved audible  
sprinkler flow alarm to alert the occupants shall be provided in the interior 
of the building in a normally occupied location.  An approved listed 

INTERNATIONAL EUILMNG CODE (2012 EDITION) 	 PAGE 19 0F36 
627447.2 



mechanical alarm shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system.  
No electrically operated appliance shall be used.  

Section 905 Standpipe Systems of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

9051 Installation standards. Standpipe systems shall be installed in accordance 
with this section and NFPA 14. Manual dry systems shall be supervised with a 
minimum of 10 psi g and maximum of 40 Nig air pressure with a high/low alarm.  
Manual dry systems can be installed when the buildings do not exceed four stories 
in heieht from the level of the fire apparatus access road and when approved bv 
the fire code official.  

905.3.1 Height -Floor Area. 	 e3119 

is located 
e-lowest level of Lire department 

vehicle access, or when ore 
than 30 feet (91+1  ITN* below the highest level of fire department-vehiele 
access. Class I standpipe systems shall be installed throughout buildings 
where the floor area is greater than ten thousand (10,000) square feet per 
floor or the floor level of the highest story is located  more than 30 feet 
(9144 mm) above the lowest level of the fire department vehicle access, or  
where the floor level of the lowest story is located below the highest level  
of fire department vehicle access.  

To determine the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, it shall 
not be required to consider recessed loading docks for four (4) or less 
vehicles and conditions where topography makes access from the fire 
department vehicle to the building impractical or impossible. 

Exceptions:  [Delete all exceptions and replace with the 
following.] 

1. Group U Occupancies.  

2. Where  the building is determined to meet section 503.1.1 by the  
fire code official, standpipe outlets can be provided as required by  
the fire code official.  

905.3.3 Covered and open mall buildings. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged.] 

5. At other locations as necessary so that the distance to reach all 
portions of a tenant spaces does not exceed 200 feet (60 960 mm) 
150 feet (45 720 mm) as the hose would be laid from a hose 
connection., 

905.4 Location of Class I standpipe hose connections. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged.] 

throughout 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
6274472 

PAGE 20 OF 36 



5. Where the roof has a slope less than four units vertical in 12 units 
horizontal (33.3-percent slope),--a each two-way hose connection shall be 
located to serve the roof or at the highest landing of a stairway with stair 
access to the roof provided in accordance with Section 1009.16. 

6. Where the most remote portion of a non-sprinklered floor or story is 
more than 150 feet as the hose would be laid (45 720 mm) from a hose 
connection or the most remote portion of a sprinklered floor or story is 
more than 200 (60 960 mm)  150 (45 720 mm) feet as the hose would be 
laid from a hose connection, the fire code official is authorized to require 
that additional hose connections be provided in approved locations. 

Section 906 Portable Fire Extinguishers of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

906.1 Where required. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

1. In new and existing Group A, B, E, F, 1-I, 1, M, R-1, R2, R-4 and S 
occupancies 

Exception: [Exception remains unchanged.] 

Section 907 Fire Alarms and Detection Systems of the 2012 International Building 
Code is be amended as follows: 

907.1.3.1 Design Standards. All new or replacement alarm  
systems serving alarm actuating devices shall be addressable fire 
detection systems. Alarm system serving more than twenty (20) 
smoke detectors  or more than 200 total alarm activating devices 
shall be analog intelligent addressable fire detection systems  

Exception: Existing systems need not comply unless the  
total building remodel or expansion initiated after the 
effective date of this code, as  adopted, exceeds thirty  
_reent (30%) of the building remodel or expansion  
exceeds fifty  percent (50%) of the building. Such systems  
must comply within twelve (12) months of the permit 
application date.  

907.2.1 Group A. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant 
notification system in accordance with new Section 907.5 shall be 
installed in Group A occupancies where the occupancy load due to the 
assembly occupancy is 300 or more persons or more than 100 persons 
above or below the lowest level of exit discharge. Group occupancies not 
separated from one another in accordance with Section 707.3.9 shall be 
considered a single occupancy for the purposes of applying this section. 
Portions of Group E occupancies occupied for assembly purposes shall be 
provided with a fire alarm system as required for the Group E occupancy. 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (21112 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 21 OF 36 
62'7447 2 



Exception: [Exception remains unchanged.] 

Activation of fire alarm notification appliances shall: 

1. Cause illumination of the means of egress with light of not less 
than  I foot-candlex  at the walking,surface level:, and  

2. Stop any conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distractions. 

907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system that initiates the occupant 
notification signal utilizing an emergency voice/alum communication 
system meeting the requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and installed in 
accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group E educational  
occupancies. When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are 
installed, such systems or detectors must be connected to the building fire 
alarm system.Ai_a_gpm.yed smoke detection system shall be installed in  
GroupE day care occupancies. Unless separated by a minimum of 100 
feet open space, all buildings, whether portable buildings or the main  
building will be considered one building for alarm occupant load 
consideration and interconnection of alarm systems 

Exceptions: [Entire exceptions deleted.] 

907.2.8 Group R-1. [Paragraph remains unchanged' 

907.2.8.1 Manual fire alarm system. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

not required in building  
al 

. : 	 awl spaces to 
those-units-are-separated-from each- ether and public, or 
common areas by at least 1 hour fir-e partitions-and-each 

. 	. 	. 

exit court or yard. 

1. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required throuahout the 
building when all of the followingsonditions are met:  

1.1. The building is equipped throughout with an 
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. and 

1.2. The notification appliances will activate upon 
sprinkler water flow; and  

not more t 

xit-directly to a public way, 

iNTERNATIONAL  BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 22 OF 36 

627447,2 



ss.  that leads 
directly to the exits or-are-se 

provided-that-dw 

13. At least one manual fire alarm box is 
installed at an approved location. 

907.2.8.1.1 Guest Rooms. Manual  fire alarm boxes shall 
be installed in all  interior  and exterior corridors serving 
guest rooms.  

907.2.9 Group 1Z-1 [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

907.2.9.1 Manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system 
that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with 
Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group R-2 occupancies-where4. 

-1.  Any dwelling unit or sleepg 	it is located three or 
iseharge; 

3. The building contains more than 1-6 dwelling oaks or 
sleeping units. 

Exceptions: 

1. A fire- 
Aling-units--of 

sleeping-units-and- contiguous-attic--and-erawl-spaees-are 
enaratec n- areas-by 

at least  1 hour  fire partitions-and-eaeh-dw-elling-uni1-er 
sleeping unit has an exit directly to a  public way,  exit court 
or yard. 

Z.Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the 
building is equipped throughout with an automatic 
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 
903.3.1.1 or 9033.1.2 and the occupant notification 
appliances will automatically activate throughout the 
notification zones upon a sprinkler water flow. 

444+FIT 
	 do 

flet-have-inteliap-eeffideFS -SePrilig-tlwelling-units-awd-afe 
protected  by an approved auttinialic sprinkler system 

1.1 or  903.3.1.2,  

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 23 Or 36 
627447.2 



907.2.13 High-rise buildings. [Paragraph remains unchanged] 

Exceptions: 

3. Buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in 
accordance with Section 303.1. However, this exception 
does not apply to accessory uses including but not limited 
to sky boxes, restaurants and similarly enclosed spaces. 

907.6.1.1 Installation. All fire alarm systems shall be installed in 
such a manner that a failure of any single initiating device or single 
open in an initiating circuit conductor will not interfere with the 
normal operation of other such devices. All signaling line circuits 
(SLC) shall be installed in such a way that a single open will not 
interfere with the operation of any addressable devices (Class A).  
Outgoinu and return SLC conductors shall be installed in  
accordance with NFPA 72 requirements for Class A circuits and  
shall have a minimum of four feet separation horizontal and one 
foot vertical between supply and return circuit conductors. The 
initiating device circuit from  an addressable ingut. (monitor) 
module may be wired Class B provided the distance from the 
addressable module to the initiating device is 10 feet or less.  

907.6.32 High-rise buildings. In high-rise buildings, 55 feet (16 
764 mm) or greater in height, a separate zone by floor shall be 
provided for each of the following types of alarm-initiating devices 
where provided: [Remainder of subsection unchanged.] 

907.6.5.3 Communication requirements. All alarm systems, new 
or replacement shall  trgnsmit alarm. supervisory and trouble  
skals descriptively to the approved central station, remote  
supervisory station or proprietary supervising station as defined in 
NFPA 72, with the correct device designation and location of 
addressable device identification. Alarms shall not be permitted to 
be transmitted as a General Alarm or Zone condition. 

Section 910 Smoke and Heat Removal of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

910.1 General. [Paragraph remains unchanged] 

Exceptions: 

2. Where areas of buildings are equipped with early suppression 
fast-response (ESFR) sprinklers, automatic only manual smoke and 
heat vents shall net be required within these areas. Automatic 
smoke and heat vents are prohibited. 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 24 OF 36 
627447.2 



910.2.3 Group H. Buildings and portions thereof used as a Group  
occupancy as follows:  

1. In occupancies classified as Group H-2 or 11-3, any of which are 
more than 15,000 square feet  (1394 m2) in single floor area.  

Exception: Etuildinvs of noncombustible construction 
containing only noncombustible materials. 

2. In areas of buildings in Group_H used for storing Class 2, 3, and 
4 liquid and solid  oxidizers, Class I and unclassified detonable  
organic peroxides, Class 3 and 4 unstable (reactive) materials. or 
Class 2 or 3 water-reactive materials as required for a high-hazard  
commodity classification.  

Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction 
containing only noncombustible materials.  

910.2.4 Exit access travel distance increase. Buildings and portions 
thereof used as a Group F-1 or S-1 occupancy where the maximum exit 
access travel  distance is increased in accordance with Section 10163. 

910.3.2.2 Sprinklered Buildings. Where installed in buildings 
provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system, smoke and 
heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically. The 
automatic operating mechanism of the smoke and heat vents shall 
operate at a temperature rating at least 100 degrees F 
(approximately 38 degrees Celsius) greater than  the temperature 
rating of the sprinklers installed.  

Table 910.3 
REQUIREMENTS FOR DRAFT CURTAINS AND SMOKE AND HEAT VENTS"' 

OCCUPANCY GROUP 
AND COMMODITY 
CLASSIFICATION 

Group H, F-1 and S-1 

Section 912 Fire Department Connections of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

912.1.1 Combination. Five inch diameter Storz and Siamese fire  
department connections shall be provided on all manual dry standpipes. 

912.2.1 Visible Location. Fire department connections shall be located on 
the street side of buildings, fully visible,and-recognizable and within fifty 
(50) feet of  from the street or nearest point of fire department vehicle 
access (fire lane)  or as otherwise approved by the fire chief code official. 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 25 0F 36 
627447.2 



9121.3 Hydrant distance. An approved fire hydrant shall be located 
within 100 feet of the fire department connection as the fire hose lays. 

912,6 Fire Department Connection Caps. All Fire Department Connections. 
FDe's, shall be metal threaded caps to prevent vandalism and tampering, 

Section 913 Fire Pumps of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

913.1 General. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

When located on the ground level at an exterior wall, the fire pump room shall be 
provided with an exterior fire department access door that is not less than 3 ft. in 
width and 6 ft. & in. in height., regardless of any interior doors that are_provided.  
A key box shall be provided at this door, as required by Section 506.1.  

Exception: When it is necessary to locate the fire pump room on other 
levels or not at an exterior wall, the corridor leading to the fire pump_room 
access from the exterior of the building shall be provided with  equivalent  
fire resistance as that required for the pump room, or as approved by the  
fire code official. Access keys shall be provided in the key box as required  
by Section 506.1.  

913.4 Valve supervision. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

3. Locking valves op. 

Garded—inspeetien—where 
*alves-are-leeated-within-fencea-enet€ 

Chapter 10. Means of Egress of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 1006 Means of Egress Illumination of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

1006.3 Emergency power for illumination. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

In the event of power supply failure, an emergency electrical system shall 
automatically illuminate all of the following areas: 

6. Toilet rooms containing two or more water closets or a combination of water 
closet and urinal.  

Section 1008 Doors, Gates and Turnstiles of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

1008.1.9.4 Bolt Locks. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODr {2012 EDITION1 
	

PAGE 26 oy 36 
627447 2 



2,-In occupancies iiQroups 13, b. F. 11, t, R 1, R 2, R 4, S and-1--where 
ith-a 

aecomlance-with Section 90: 
not exceed 50 feet (15 240 mm). 

3. Where a pair of doors serves an occupant load of less 
than 50 persons in a Group B, FM or S occupancy, 
manually operated edge- or surface-mounted bolts are 
permitted on the inactive leaf. The inactive leaf shall 
contain no doorknobs, panic bars or similar operating 
hardware. 

4. Where a pair of doors serves a Group A B, F M or S 
occupancy, manually operated edge- or surface-mounted 
bolts are permitted on the inactive leaf provided such 
inactive leaf is not needed to meet egress width 
requirements and the building is equipped throughout with 
an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 
903.3.1.1 The inactive leaf shall contain no doorknobs,, 
panic bars or similar operating hardware. 

Section 1016 Exit Access Travel Distance of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

TABLE 1016.2 
EXIT ACCESS TRAVEL DISTANCE' 

WITH SPRINKLER SYSTEM 
feet 

250 
b-Butkiaigs 
wiTh Seetion  903 3.1 1 or  93.3J.2.  See Section 903 fof  oectipancief, 

re-ato, „a 	er s ys tern s-arepermirrekt-in-deobrdarree-with-Se-otan 
00 3 1.2  

Section 1018 Corridors of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

1018.4 Dead ends. fParagraph remains unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

mzupanc - a-y-uointeaft-ter--41--tsee 
Section 308-.5), the dead end in a eawider shall net exceed 50 feet (15-240 
mm), 

3,--A dead-end corridor shall not be limited in length where the length of 
the dead-end corridor is less than 2.5 times the least width of the dead-end 
corridor. 

Section 1026 Exterior exit stairways and ramps of the 2012 International Building 
Code is amended as follows: 

iNTLIMATIONAL  BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 27 0F 36 
627447.2 



1026.6 Exterior stairway and ramp protection. [Paragraph remains 
unchanged.] 

Exceptions: 

4. Separation from the interior open-ended corridors of the 
building is not required for exterior stairways and ramps connected 
to open-ended corridors, provided that items 4.1 through 4.5 are 
met: 

Chapter 11 Accessibility of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 1101 General of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

1101.2 Design. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 
Exception: Building.ssegulated under State Law and built in accordance  
with State registered plans, Including any variance or waivers granted by  
the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements of 
this Chapter. 

Chapter 15. Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures of the 2012 International Building Code 
is amended as follows: 

Section 1503 Weather Protection of the 2012 International Building Code is amended 
as follows: 

1503.4 Roof drainage. Design and installation of roof drainage systems shall 
comply with Section 1503 of this code and Section 1106 and 1108, as applicable, 
of the International Plumbing Code. Roofs  shall be sloped a minimum of one unit  
vertical in 48 units horizontal (min. 2% slope) for drainage. Unless roofs are  
sloped to drain over roof edges, roof drains shall be installed at each low point of 
the roof. Roof drains and  gutter downspouts shall discharge into the site  storm  
drainage and detention system. Where a site storm drainage system is not  
available, roof drains and downspouts may discharge at grade provided that the  
discharge does not flow across walkways providing access to building entrances.  

15034.1 Secondary (emergency overflow) drains or scuppers. 
[Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

1503.4.2 Scuppers. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

1503.43 Gutters. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

1503.4.4 Over public prerty. Roof dra nagçwater from a buildin g  
shall not be permitted to flow over public property or onto adjacent  
properties. The building official may require that downspouts be collected  
in a storm water drainage system and discharged to the street storm gutter  
or alley.  

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 28 0E36 
627447.2 



Section 1505 Fire Classification of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

TABLE 1505.1R' ll  
MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION 

FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION 
/TABLE REMAINS UNCHANGED.] 

a. tinlesc  otherwise required  in accordance with—the 
International-W-ildioncl-Whaii-Interface-Code-or due  to the 

istfict in accordance 
with Appendix-D. All  individual revlacement shingles or 
shakes  shall be in compliance with the rating as required by 
this table  when the replacement or repair exceeds 120 square 
feet of projected roof area.  
b. Nonclassified roof coverings 	 shall may  be permitted on 
buildings of Group  R 3 and Group II occupancies, where there 
is a minimum fire-separation distance of 6 feet measured from 
the leading edge of the roof. 

1505.7 Spe 	 gle-o-r-1,veed-shake 

150-7.8 or  1507.9. En addition, an URilefkty-RiefIl of  5,48 inch (15.9 mm) Type X  
water--resi 	 v-shall-be-plaeed-under 

1-2.7  mm) wood structural panel solid sheathing 
or  1 inch (25  

Section 1506 Materials of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

1506.1.1 Wood shingles and shakes where permitted. Where the terms 

wood shingles or wood  shakes are used in this code, they shall be  
construed to mean fire-retardant treated wood shingles or shakes. The use 
of wood shingles or shakes shall be restricted to single family dwelling 

roof coverings only.  

Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

Section 1807 Foundation walls, Retaining Walls and Embedded Post and Poles of 
the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

1807.2.2 Design lateral soil loads. Retaining walls shall be 
designed for the lateral soil loads set forth in Section 1610. 
Retaining walls that are not laterally supported at the  top  and that 
retain in excess of 24  inches  (610 mm)  of unbalanced fill shall be 
designed to ensure stability against overturning, sliding, excessive 
foundation pressure and water uplift. Retaining wails that retain in 
excess of 36 inches 914 mm of unbalanced fill shall have  
professionally engineered designed to ensure  stability against  
overturning, sliding,  excessive foundation pressure and water 

nplift.  For stone  mass gravity retaining walls in excess of 24 inches 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 29 (IV 36 
627447.2 



(610 mm), minimum foundation embedment shall be no less than 
12 inches (305 mm) into undisturbed or well compacted soil.  

Chapter 27. Electrical of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 2701 General of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

2701.1 Scope. This chapter governs the electrical components, equipment and 
systems used in buildings and structures covered by this code. Electrical 
components, equipment and systems shall be designed and constructed in 
accordance with the provisions of NFPA 70 the 2011 National Electrical Code, as 
adopted by Frisco. as it currently exists or may be amended. 

Chapter 28. Mechanical Systems of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

Section 2801 General of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

2801.1 Scope. Mechanical appliances, equipment and systems shall be 
constructed, installed and maintained in accordance with the International 
Mechanical Code and the International Fuel Gas Code. Masonry chimneys, 
fireplaces and barbecues shall comply with the International Mechanical Code 
and Chapter 21 of this code. 

Chapter 29. Plumbing Systems of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

Section 2901 General of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the International Plumbing Code 
shall govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, 
addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Toilet and 
bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1210. Plumbing 
systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed and maintained in 
accordance with the International Plumbing Code.  Private sewage disposal 

mat i am 

Chapter 31. Special Construction of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as 
follows: 

Section 3103 Temporary Structures of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

3103.1 General. The provisions of Sections 3103.1 through 3103.4 shall apply to 
structures erected for a period of less than 180 days. Tents and other membrane 
structures erected for a period of less than 180 days shall comply with the 
International Fire Code Those erected for a longer period of time shall comply 
with applicable sections of this code. Temporary, moved or portable type 
structures shall be prohibited in Frisco except in the following conditions: 

INTERNATIONAL 'WILDING CODE  j2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 30 OF 36 

6274-17.2 



L Mobile homes or manufactured homes in the appropriate zoning 
districts.  

2. Residential accessory buildings not exceeding one hundred sixty (160) 
square feet. Accessory buildings in excess of one hundred (100)  sa_ _late 
feet must be of exterior materials similar to the main  structure. Accessory 
buildings in excess of one hundred sixty (160) square feet must meet the 
masonry requirements of Section 36.9 of Frisco's Comprehensive Zoning 
Ordinance No. 04-05-11, as it currently exists or may  be amended.  

3. Temporary sales  offices in  residential  subdivisions for a period not to 
exceed one hundred twenty (120) days, during construction of model 
homes.  

4. Temporary construction offices may be permitted in residential  
subdivisions; however, the permit  shall  expire and the office removed  
when  nir_z.ty_ggcent En)  of the lots in the subdivision served by the  
office have been sold. Temporary construction on commercial  
construction sites must be removed at the completion of the project served  

office 	prior to  the  issuance of a  Certificate  of Occupancy.  

5, Schools (kindergarten (K) through grade twelve (12)), churches or 
governmental agencies may apply for a permit for a new, temporary  
portable building, provided that evidence of immediate need for additional  
space is submitted. Plans must be submitted to provide for a permanent 
solution to the  immediate need such that a time limitation may be  
estatzlished  for the temporary structure. Temporary structures may be 
permitted for a maximum period of two (2) years. Sixty (60) days prior to 
expiration of the permitted time. Frisco may attempt to notify the owner  
of the permit expiration; however, Frisco's failure to provide such 
notification shall not waive its right  to  enforce any and all provisions of 
this Ordinance.  Any extensions to the time period can only be approved  
by the City Council. City Council may den the extension if owner has not  
proceeded or failed to make significant progress  toward the permanent  
solution.  

3103.1.1 Permit required. Tempora structures that cover an -area 
greater than  120  square feet (11.16 in), including-connecting areas or 
pacoa  with a common means of egress or entrance which are used  or 

intended-to  be us ore persons,  shall  
not  be  erected, operated  or maintained for-any-purpese-without-ebtaining a 
permit from the---building—ollic47 No tem-porarv, moved, or portable  
structure shall be erected. installed, operated or maintained for  ani 
purpose without obtaining a permit  from the building official.  

Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices of the 2012 International 
Building Code is amended as follows: 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 12012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 31 OF 36 

274472 



3109.1 General. Swimming pools shalt comply with the requirements Section 
3109.2 through 3109.5 and other applicable sections of this code.. Provisions a 
this section shall not be deemed to nullify any applicable State laws  rules. 
regulations and/or requirements, as they exist, may be amended or in the future  
arising. 

3109.2 Definition. The following term is defined in Chapter 2 

SWIMMING POOLS. 

PRIVATE POOL. Any swimming pool appurtenant to a single family or duplex 
residence and used only by the  occupants of the residence and their guests.  

PUBLIC POOL. Any swimming pool to which the general public has access.  

SEMI-PUBLIC POOL. Any swimming pool that is privately owned and open 
only  class of persons, including, but not limited to, motel guests, 
apartment residents and club or association members.  

3109.3 Public swimming pools. [Paragraph remains unchanged.] 

3109.3.1 Semi-public pools. Semi-public swimming pools shall be  
completely enclosed with a fence or screen enclosure at least six (6) feet in 
height. Openings in the fence shall not permit the  passage of a four (4)  
inch diameter sphere. Gates shall be selfLelosing and  self-latching. The  
enclosure shall cornply with the requirements in Section 1109.4.1,  

1109.4 Residential swimming pools. Residential or private  swimming pools 
shall comply with Sections 3109.4.1 through 3109.4.3. 

Chapter 33. Safeguards During Construction of the 2012 International Building Code is 
amended as follows: 

Section 3305 Sanitary of the 2012 International Building Code is amended as follows: 

3305.1 Facilities required.  Sanitary  facilities —shall  be  pr.e.,41ed during  
contructiori  remodell 	 'th 	 the 

Each permitted construction project in Frisco shall 
be provided with at least one (1) temporary portable toilet facility for use by 
errdoyees and subcontractors. Builders or contractors with multiple permits in a 
subdiyisionAbas_r_gyide  one portable toilet for a maximum five permits. Portable  
toilet facilities shall be located in the rear portion of lots where alley access is 
available. Portable toilet facilities shall not be placed in street or alleLright-of-
ways. The builder or permit holder  shall be  responsible for ensuring that toilet 
facilities are maintainedinA  sanitary m The building official may, at his 
discretion, require  that additional toilet facilities be provided if these requirements 
prove to be insufficient.  

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EtwITION) 
	

PAGE 32 OF 36 
627447 2 



3305.2 rfrash i1qegp4cleF,,Erlitjgd  construction Troject in Frisco shall be 
provided with receptacles of a sufficient size and number to contain jobsite trash  
and  debris. including, but not limited to, food wrappers and containers from 
workers lunches. Trash receptacles shall be maintained on site at all times during 
construction activities. The builder or permit holder  shall  be responsible for  
ensuring that trash receetacles are utilized by all employees and subcontractors.  
and that all trash is removed at intervals adequate to maintain a clean job site. In  
addition to the required receptacles, each lot shall be irovided with screen fencing 
to prevent wind-blown trash and debris from adjacent lots. 

(REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK] 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 12012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 33 OF 36 

627447 2 



INDEX 

(The Index is provided for informational purposes only to note the 
location of the deletions/additions in the 2012 International Building 

Code as set forth in this Ordinance) 

102.4 Referenced codes and standards 	 4 
105.2 Work exempt from permit  	 4 
108.1 General 	 4 
109.2 Permit, Inspection and Miscellaneous Consolidated Fee Schedule 	 5 
10922 Plan review fees 	 8 
109.6 Refunds. 	8 
110.3.5 Lath and gypsum board inspection. 	  
304.1 Business Group B 	 
311.2 Moderate-hazard storage, Group 5-1 	 9 
403.1 Applicability 	 9 
403.3 Automatic sprinkler system 	 9 
403.5.4 Smokeproof enclosures 	 9 
406.3.4 Separation 	  9 
406,8 Repair garages 	  10 
501.2 Address identification    10 
504.2 Automatic sprinkler system increase 	  11 
506.2.2 Open space limits ... 	  11 
508.1 General 	 11 
510.4 Parking beneath Group R 	 12 
708.3 Fire-resistance rating 	 12 
708.4 Continuity 	 12 
903.1.2 Residential Systems 	 13 
903.2 Where required 	  13 
903.2.1 Group A 	 13 
903.2.1.1 Group A-1 	 13 
903.2.1.2 Group A-2 	  13 
903.2.1.3 Group A-3 .. 	  14 
903.2.1.4 Group A-4  	 14 
903.2.2.1 Group B.  	 14 
903.2.3 Group E 	 14 
903.2.4 Group F-1 	  14 
903.2.6 Group I 	 15 
903,2.7 Group M 	 15 
903.2.8.3 Group R additions 	  15 
903.2.9 Group S-1 	  15 
903.2.9.1 Repair garages 	  16 
903.2.9.3 Self-service storage facilities   16 
903.2.10 Group S-2 enclosed parking garages 	 16 
903.2.10.2 Group S-2 open raking garages   16 
903.2.11 Specific building areas and hazards 	  16 
903,2.113 Buildings 35 feet or more in height 	  17 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE120.12 EDITION) 
627447 

PAGE 34 OF 36 



903.2.11.7 New and  Existing  buildings   	 17 
9032.11.8 Spray Booths and Rooms   	 17 
903.3.1 Standards 	 17 
903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations 	17 
903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems 	 17 
9033,1,2.1 Balconies and decks 	 18 
903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems-.  	...    18 
903.3.5 Water supplies 	  18 

18 
903.3.5.1 One  and Two-Family dwelling combination  services 	  18 
94] 	 filikleisystems 	 18 
903.3.5.1.2 Residential combination service 	  19 
4-C 	 supply 	 19 
903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms 	 19 
903.4.2 Alarms 	 19 
905.2 Installation standards 	 20 
905.3.1 Height 	 20 
905.3.1 Floor Area 	 20 
905.3.3 Covered and open mall buildings 	 20 
905.4 Location of Class I standpipe hose connections 	 20 
906.1 Where required 	 21 
907.1.3.1 Design Standards   	 21 
907,2.1 Group A 	 21 
907.2.3 Group E 	 22 
907 .2.8 Group R-I  	 22 
907.2.8.1 Manual fire alarm system 	 22 
907.2.8.1.1 Guest Rooms 	 22 
907.2.9. Group R-2 	 22 
907.2.9.1 Manual fire alarm system 	 23 
907,2,13 High-rise buildings 	 23 
907.6.1.1 Installation 	 24 
907.6.3.2 High-rise buildings 	... „ 	  24 
907.6.5.3 Communication requirements, 	 24 
910.1 General  	 24 
910.2.3 Group If  	 24 
910.2.4 Exit access  travel distance increase 	 25 
910.3.22 Sprinklered Buildings 	 25 
912.1.1 Combination  	 25 
912.2.1 Visible Location 	 25 
912,2.3 Hydrant distance  	 25 
912.6 Fire Department Connection Caps  	 25 
913.1 General  	 25 
913.4 Valve supervision 	 26 
1006.3 Emergency power for illumination 	 26 
1008.1.9.4 Bolt Locks  	 26 
1016.2 Exit access travel distance 	 27 
1018.4 Dead ends 	 27 
1€126k Exterior stairway and ramp protection  	271101.2 Design 

	 28 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EmTION1 
	

PAGE 35 OF 36 
62144L2 



1503.4 Roof drainage 	 28 
1503.41 Secondary (emergency overflow) drains or scupppers 	 28 
1503.4.2 Scuppers 	 28 
1503.4.3 Gutters 	 28 
1503.4.4 Over public property 	28 
1505.7 Special purpose roofs 	 29 
1506.1.1 Wood shingles and shakes where permitted .. 	  29 
1807.2.2 Design lateral soil loads 	 29 
2701.1 Scope 	 29 
2801.1 Scope. 	 30 
2901.1 Scope 	 30 
3103.1 General 	 30 
3103.1.1 Permit required 	 31 
3109.1 General 	 31 
3109.2 Definition 	 31 
3109.3 Public swimming pools 	 31 
3109.3.1 Semi-public pools  	32 
3109.4 Residential swimming pools 	 32 
3305.1 Facilities required 	 32 
3305.2 Trash receptacles 	 32 

END OF EXHIBIT "A" 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (2012 EDITION) 
	

PAGE 36 OF 36 
627447 2 


